Rt &, $.ue.- 33004/99 REGD. No. D. L.-33004/99

Che Gazette of India

1.5, -31.Te1.-31.-15092022-238863
CG-DL-E-15092022-238863

ETITIOT
EXTRAORDINARY
AT | —ave 3—SI-T@7 (i)
PART I1—Section 3—Sub-section (i)

TR & THTIAT
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

T, 625] 7% faeett, JgertaaT, faw 15, 2022/915 24, 1944
No. 625] NEW DELHI, THURSDAY, SEPTEMBER 15, 2022/BHADRA 24, 1944

IENEEIED]
(e fawm)
(FET TTTE T AT T o A12)
Fgg=AT
7% fawett, 15 foawae, 2022
%. 79/2022- 4T 97 (TT.&.)
L., 705(s1).—F AT ATI=aH, 1962 (1962 FT 52) T 9T 157 & AT qi5d &=T 519
% Tgd Jad AThAl T TINT Fd gU, Heald IS HT U A qIE, TAIENT, TAFE( [ el hiee
ST AT, 2021 F HTe F3  foru Atertera rfe=s a=mar g, 79T -
1. wferd offd= e g — (1) =7 AfFawT i1 saFeivs e wiee doe (THTHe) W, 2022
Fgl ST
(2) I A= ST TS § SO TR il e F AL g
2. TAFCIHT S[ET hiee Ao Wgaa, 2021 H,-
(i) fFw 6 ®, IT-fAfFTw (2) #, ‘U au” or=al F T 9T, ‘T AW Tl FI, Taedriid
(KRUSIESIF
iy fFEw 7 4 su-RfFgw (3) #, “uw F o=l F T Uz, ‘ar 9 sl &I, viaettud
ERIES I

[FT. &. HeTemEeT-140605/12/2021-0/o fRzer(srieramantt)-shef=f]
ar. I, #iT, sEw gt

6215 G1/2022 @)



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

e T ATSE=AT "EAT 75/2021-Hwmees (.2), At 23 fdew, 2021 v 9nFL[. 654(3) i
o 23 e, 2021 % Tgd 91d & TSI, TETLT, F A6 I, G 3, 36 (i) § o fhar
T AT
MINISTRY OF FINANCE
(Department of Revenue)
(CENTRAL BOARD OF INDIRECT TAXES AND CUSTOMS)
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 15th September, 2022
No. 79/2022-Customs (N.T.)

G.S.R. 705(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by section 51B read with section 157 of the
Customs Act, 1962 (52 of 1962), the Central Board of Indirect Taxes and Customs, hereby makes the
following regulations to amend the Electronic Duty Credit Ledger Regulations, 2021, namely:-

1. Short title and commencement — (1) These regulations may be called the Electronic Duty Credit
Ledger (Amendment) Regulations, 2022.

(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.
2. In the Electronic Duty Credit Ledger Regulations, 2021,-

(i) in regulation 6, in sub-regulation (2), for the words “one year”, the words “two years”, shall be
substituted:;

(ii) in regulation 7, in sub-regulation (3), for the words “one year”, the words “two years”, shall be
substituted.

[F. No. CBIC-140605/12/2021-O/o Dir(Drawback)-CBEC]
O. P. MEENA, Under Secy.

Note : The principal notification No. 75/2021-Customs (N.T.), dated the 23 September, 2021 was
published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part I, Section 3, Sub-section (i), vide number
G.S.R. 654(E), dated the 23 September, 2021]

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi- 110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054. waosxuss




		2022-09-15T21:49:32+0530
	MANOJ KUMAR VERMA




