It 4. ST 33004/99 REGD. No. D. L.-33004/99

Che Gazette of India

Gr.5M.-31.Te1.-31.-02062022-236259
CG-DL -E-02062022-236259

AT
EXTRAORDINARY

AT 1 —ETE 4
PART Il1—Section 4

AT F THAT
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

H. 283 TE foeell, TEEafeaTe, 5[ 2, 2022/5355 12, 1944
No. 283 NEW DELHI, THURSDAY, JUNE 2, 2022/JYAISHTHA 12, 1944

EIPEEI
< faeedt, 2 54, 2022

|, 1-917(7)/201/2022.— FTEE AFT3ceq ATHAH, 1988 FT AT 3T HTYT FIA % (o1 FHIaaT
At 1 Meferfaa s, e st 9mes samsden weam it TR a9 7 I dq1d Fdl §, q1es
AFr3ced ATAHAH, 1949 (1949 FT 38) i &T 30 it ITLTT (3) =l FUATTATL, UH THT AFAAT I,
ST IHE TATTT B T TATAAT &, TSI % o7 THRITArd a1 Sar 8 ; o I8 =1 &F ot g &
3ad W= AT oY, 39 e /1, REar 9ea F vE e S gtagr, e w e Gt
TERTIAT AT SITAT g, ST &l Susel Fl &f STl &, o (& 0 STaid & (a9 & T (941 ohar
SITUAT,

S g fAfqaw & dag § A AT AT GHATT TET FA T Toged hls ATHT WA ATes
AFTIecd He™ i TRUE T 39 WX fo=m & s & forw 58 3ox Ry safy % e, 9=,
AT ATee AFSccd Hed™, ASHITAE Fad, T9ed q, 95 fGeedt -110002 FT FSATT Fd gU
SATUT FT T

et = & S Wiy fAfFeEt & @9y § =9 v AfAfdse safe & saae & 3@ s T
e AT g o7 afiwg g e T s

EISSEREIE DL
I (1) = izt &7 gferg 9 =91 aarsee (qae aered) e, 2022 § 1
(2) T TSI § 3ok SATAH T 6T AE F AR ZT |

3713 GI1/2022 )




2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART 1I—SEC.4]

2. ATEE AFT3ecH fafaaw, 1988 ), -
1. o= 5 9, IT-RfFEw (1) F @ (%) F Ta7q FEfetad Tqs sia:eamiad o SToT, seIq;-

"o AT TS =7ten, Sra AT 54 6 % et e st wforeror qur ¢ ot €, 99 a6 qeet
F Ty | 9AT AW IfAY FA FT gHAT A8l g I aF (o IHT -G89 9T qRus g 247
ey srfaf=s qmrar a=est &1 @ 951 AT ar 1"

2. fafe=w 9 & Su-fafaaw (1) % T+ = Aeferfeaa w@r S, ereri -

"(1) FE TGEET, TS AFTIee f &T H HAATT FA o [T T B F THII-T % {ol0 IR0 Fl e
T AT

i UET A A, P T oft a9 "9eew F w9 § s G @ g, G e S 9
AFTIeC & AT AdT TH UF a9 o Hld AT 6 T 1 ST I HATETT THIT-T o [oIT 97 ZIT

g Tg AT TF Agar-0 U A9 F FT A9 T TTAT UH TEET F (o7 AN A2t g, e vEr sraae
T T AT | T TEadT T a9 a0l rater § el Saamaed FAr 9ee Aarsec & a7 77 § 77 UH
9 £ srafar = foro e frar 2"

3. fafaam 257 i 259 1 o9 3T S |

4. A=W 253 #, 3u-fAfAaw (2) F wanq Fefertad u-fafe=s (3) siaeafua B s, s -
"(3) = fafA=wT # siafae fFEft am % g gu f, ufius, A= 258 F aefie wrsee™ 9rsawH 8q
TISTELIRTOT SAEH I o THTY, HEAT Al qadT1ze 9T UH AT TR Hd gU = A aad & Tefiq wras e
TSI o TorT TREEsheor &l §a T Tt 1"

5. fafaaw 259 #, I9-A=H (3) & TaTq Maferiaa su-fafaae (4) sta:eamfua frar Srosm, s -
"(4) =7 FAfawt @ safae ot ara & gra gu o, aRwe, Afaaw 259 & arefie wrssem after sy g
& TETY, =0 ATHIH F el FISST TEHEAT T AT 9 HT F(T AT ALATHAT F Tg AUTeT g 1
F faf=w 2557 % o1 a07-997 9% TRUE T STAIad TTSI=aT % JTHTY R3S TEET IO Al

6. fafaaw 259 % warq, Maferiaa AT 258 s 259 sa:emfud B ST, oidQ-
"25%. WSS TSI & forg Toredaeor

(1) TrET AT srearef 7 T9 T FISS9H I & oI TEiahd Agl FhaT ST STa a o I8 913 &
farfer grer =i foRet 9e M g |=tera F&T 10 T 9L&T a7 AT | J18Y ha 1 94t AT T
LT G I<h TLAT 6 A T e (el 37+ TrET 7 307 7 7 (o3 2r |

(2) Su-fafa=w (1) # siafae Bt o 919 & gia gu o, vaT #re srenedt, e = Fff==t & ofefs a2
& FTHT TAOTAT TS H AT FISS T TTSTHH 6 (o0 TS rehr T form §, UHT o o orefi= T2 gu,
ST 9ug g e & 9, 39 ARt F e wreeed areaw § §9Radd & o ar g |

(3) FTSTIT ITSTRH & TorT TIree T, TR or/Eaade #if ariig & had 97¢ a9 il A9 6 o
e g |

(4) FTE AT FISSIAT TTSTHHA g TSl w0 & o0 TRUE FRT QAT T8 | & & aref Ul
T T HE HT, ST FHT-H80T 9 TR0E g7 HFq it S0 ST S 959 g9 290 § A8 Tgl g
TR UET FE AT, ST A 7 gy A #3717 @ 8, UHy B9 w1 1 F 30, S 9 g 997-
T 9 A & ST

2537, ETSSA TEEAT § TA9T, FI 3T qraa=a1

(1) et oft srerefT 7 O o BTSS 9T TLIEAT § gl o (&F7 STua S a  feh--




[\ 1H—ETE 4] T T TSI © T 3

(F) Fg TEITT F FLAAT A1 F a1 39 919 hY, /s q8eqr 7 Arare= F31 =T g, U arg &y aqv
SHH qF AT AT TTE T ST o o7 TSTEEhd 7l 3T I UHT 3T TAeATAT T AqATAT 7 ¥ @47
g, ST FHT-T8YT % THUg FET AT il S0 ; i

(@) 9= wreq | fater gy i Gt aftar e g g=fera sgav areafe (10+2) #it adyer a7
AT & FTEY Ha T AL IT TeT TLHT G HATqH TISTHH § T4 % TATS g Sh TLEAT 6 THH h
& § ATAqT a1 it TS foheft srer qdvear v S<hof 7 &< o an )

(2) ETSSAT TAT T ATS reefT Ut B T @G w, S g g M fir S s S e oft
T T AT T H AT A5l gt

uiq UAT A v, S AR & arge FarE w5 w7 @ §, UHT B & HE FOI, S 9Rug g 99y-
T a7 fFga & s

(3) FTSTT TherT F ey srwreft i Ut qrem=at ° wefea adver o srostt, o aae-awy 97 g
FT ST 3T ST 1"

7. TR 28+ 3fi¥ 28% 1 =19 T SO

8. fafa=w 28 #, I9-AfH=w (6) F =T, Fefoiag su-Ffaaw (7) siaeataa BT s, st -
"(7) == AfRTwi # siafas BT a1 & 2a gu oft, TR, AREw 289 F orefia Hegadt areawd 2q
TR A B o T, AT I a3 T2 Uk AT I Fd g0 = A= F = gegadi
TSI o TorT TREEheor &l §a T Tt 1"

9. fafeaw 287 ¥, I9-fafvaw (4) & e Mefated 3u-faaw (5) sia:wamfua Bam STos, st -
"(5) =71 fafaawi # siafae et ara = ra gu o, afus, fAfFaw 28 & srefia wegady 9der e g
F 7T, =9 A F qefie weaadt e 7 are a7 w5 gl o vt & 7g srafea gem
fafaaw 2871 = srefie F9I-9AT 9% TR g7 ATHIRT TTST9AT 6 SATHTL Heqad| TLET I 3 1"
10. faf=m 283 & weaTq, Meferfeaa fafaaw 28 s 28= sia:eaiua fhu ST, sterq -

"28%T. WeEdT UTSIRH oIy Toredisheor 3fiT e

"(1) ATES TRTSSHT el & forT sTeaae TS s H1 HeAad! TISThe & &9 § A7Ha T ST, s
AT & oo R, st 9 g | s aqz 1 |

(2) et T sreeff &1 99 aF FeAad! qreaEd U IREERT dal AT ST 99 a& 6 39T 39
=T & el wSeas 98T ST W ® AT 9G¥ arge fAter gy waviva R adrear e g
TATforT Sga< ATeAfiE (10+2) T AT AT FET LR AT ST ACHIE g HTqF ITHT H 990 F
AT g 36 TLHAT & AT 6 &9 § AIam T #f T2 TRt o 930eT & 3Tt 7 F7 foaw gr am
T 17 SATLATAT T ATATAT F Y [orAT &, ST GHI-HHT 92 TUg g7 A2 6 S

T UAT Fre AeredT S| == Afaaet & otefie werer a8 T A1 aohtel | WSS e areT A7 g forer
(TETET - 1) IT AT TS0 GLEAT AT B3I TLAT I T AT g, UHT ot & efiT g gu, s
ufrag grer fAfafEe i simd, za faffam & eefie weaadt areawa § T % forg o g

g A8 A T vET e erewefi, S uger & aohiet | qegadi Ar i QAT (qrsawma- 1) AT qegadi
(FFTF TEAFAT) qTSAHT AT HEAAAT (THIFA Frih TATAT) TSIHT AT =9 [AAIAT 6 Tefi= qegqadi
TSI o o0 TSrediand o, UHT ot & o7l Ygd gu, Sr afvus gy [AiEe & 9o, =o A== & arefia
HeATAT ITSIh T | IR o oI 91 gT |

(3) Su-fafa=w (2) # siafae et ara & g gu «F faffTw 2(1) & suEs (ix) # o e FE @mas 4T
HTAHIAL AT Ta ATAT A¥AT 3T THT HEATAT TTSAHH F TTEIHE0 g T T, TS UHT A T<h--




4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART 1I—SEC.4]

(F) AT | AT AT ATARCL Agal T@dl g o S [aferfaa G, staiq s, goder,
T fafer, e fafer, seforre, s (Bi yegw afgd), Fereme (R siasa Tore w2 &t i
eaer Fw fafer off §), a0, AT TATH AT T8 T@ihT AT 39 @G0 6 o & s foe-fae
ATHT AT 3177 U Ay, g 6T & Sreqae a1e gy Aquiiad AT 37 8, § § Hag IS i a9
FrATATS | fohegl i Aoy, e Toas aifees § =AaH 94979 & 7 UF a9 H 3 F77 &7 F TFH |7
IT SATEF 3 8, AT AAAT Fd gU [l AT [aeata=med (BEs siaia {6 faeafemad 9T §)
FIRT HATOId IEAT § e 3iehl | & ~qAqH TaTH TTA9T 30 AT I8 THqed U< H[ 919 har g ; a1

(@) T (F) § TATEAGE ATqF AT AR Agal o (9 2ar @dar g v 39+ Fhet Arvgamme
st (e siavia g frafaemes ff §) g d=rora a3reT § $ ol § ¥ =7q8 q918 Tiaerd
3 AT IHH TAA U AT I a7 2 |

TSR - TH Y- 9| o JFe & o -

(i) SRt o Tfaera it w¥rorET o forg, 39 Aot & s st o Bt spendt @ feafemmes (s sara
qh fesafaemera AT 8) 1T et ST 3% ITH T shl STT&T 6l STy § SiY [oH Iga< sl & (o0 &ils
ferere wiee yaT= A8t FaT ST, u% edm Jgi o3 ST ; s

(ii) ser 37 37fere o foRelt oft STE T T 3Tel qUiteh o =T § TUET § A7 SITUar ofiw oney o | %7 & foher
AT I¥ AT A1 (AT ST |

(4) 3u-fafaTw (2) & siafae et ama & 2ra gu o, UaT #1 srvgeff, ST et |ATaeh/@TashiaT 9T &
HTEAT qY FT TLTAT FX 1T &, TELAAAT TISIAFHH g AATAH TISTEL IR0 o (o a1 g, et Ife 39
FRT Fegad| qeT § 9o+ & o7 AEaT F3d § 99 o0 T979 1 GH1EEIE 994 T6qd [0 ST 9% #ht
STUA(T o6 39 =8 fAfRaw & Iufafaae (3) # TA7T SUSterd =qAdd dFi & a7 ATash/ATaasd TreT
S F &Y 3

Ui A% e AedT Fegadl 9T ¥ 934 % oI e 3 § @ 29 A= & sutat=as (3) & 71
SYETEd IATH 3 TTH T § TARA gl g Al ST AATAH TISTEL IR0 il Tg HT (&AT ST AT 37
=T %y & o, -

(i) 3% 39 T T At T Fgifaen fover 3 foro w3 e 7 ) faar s ; siw

(i) ufvus T Rt sreeff &, ST =9 AFEw ¥ 797 A qqemeTe 99a 5 qd 7 5 a\99d @ g,
TS ITH BIT T ITehT TSTEE 0T ST SLF I ohl UHT LA FT TAGTT FEA T SATHTT & Tel ST
o 3o g A ue At G s

g U T sreredt, S zw feaw % ygw g ° @ A 289 % e uger gF A taw e
A5 w7 oo T 7, € 7 e & Srustt o ag uHEr sty s ahug g Gt & o s S
TS a9 il WIS THAT § S5 Al TG T g AT o ATAF Al qgl (T, & AqC ATaHh qrer <o
T T FHTATIRE TG Te T H2

T T8 AT T AT e sreedt qaih srater & iaT 99d Teqd #d H ATRA @Al §, ql I SAATaH
TIELTRT T T2 ¥ (AT ST 3fiY 29 fAfaast o Jaee & foru-

(i) 3 39 FIRT T T T2 AFiTae 1qear = org v e 7gl ar ST ; 3w

(i) afvus T Rt srveff &, ST =9 AfFEw 8 791 A gqmemeTe q99q T5qa w2 5 aq9d @ g,
TG ITH ZIT O IehT TSTEL T ST SII I hl UHT THH T TAGTT FLA 0l AT & Fpel ST
& ook g gug-aag a7 fEfRtea ey s

(5) THT FrE et S AT ST "5y srRTade Afafaaw, 1959 (1959 =1 23) & Aefiq wefua wedT
AN STATSETH HEATH AT HUT qi=a AT+, 1980 (1980 FT 56) Tl TAMUT AT FAT A=
HEATT GIT HATIOTd HEAAAT TEEAT ST T 8, AT Heacl T | TS RaoT g 9T g |




[\ 1H—ETE 4] T T TSI © T 5

(6) FeTAAT ATSTHH o forw TorEdiga #rs srv et Tfue g 77 SAIed Y87 § e & a1 UHl H g
T HETT FI, ST TRUE FRT I AT ST S ST TG g T90 H AT Tl gt

TR T A el S A & Aree e w1 @ g, U B w7 gEr wa, S qwT-awy 9w gy
T A i ST

(7) == fafaaw & srefie el sropeff a1 oo, sow Tedamo/aaiads f arfg & o= ag f
safer  foro fafarmTe g

i Fre AT IEH FIT TRUE g7 Aquied TS H ATeed e (U A 9 AT UET e # w1
FT ST o, ST Oug g7 q9-H9T 9 HAq S, 90 a9 whh S 7 Sater % o Fae UE a1 O
e & forw s g |

(8) == fafa=w # siafere faedt et ama & g gu Y, Feaadt ureasa & forw TRwdiga et srereff %
Tay § 7g {1 AT AT F a7 AT A@ihT ggdag & o off a2

283, WeAadT TeAT | T, i 3T IS A

[T 2857 % el wregadt qreashd & oI Teeeiga Aeatiat &l an)

(1) T=relt oft srenefT &7 99 T Fegadi aaT § 9od Agl (<37 STUT S dh (6 ag G967 o STeqqq 9IS &
AT TREEHT Agl g AT SAA T THTF FHT TFH THIT T TEIT Al AT g 1o ITA IT AT =l Tgefl arirg
1, fSae oear srarfSra &t ST g, UHET srater & forw sfi vet Sfq § sremae arehd & @ AT g,
ST o g g qeg-aa 91 A e s
Tiq T T w1 et St AfAEw 289 % 3u-faf=aw (3) F ofefiT wemadt areand & U IEFd g,
et ATEst & QT F3T 9 qegadi Ter § 9549 & oI 97 g -

() T TH TATH T TH THI-T5 TEqd FqT g T 3899 79 & 57 1% 979 £ oatdy F o svega=

arEwH T AT E ;i
(@) 38 HEAAdT Tt H 95 | qF 3 [A=aT § TIAT ITSAT ATH 3ihl 6 T FTAH/FATARTL
TLTEAT ITAIOT FXA T THTTANE HGd TEd FL QAT |

(2) Su-fafa=w (1) # siqfae T ara & 2rd gu ot VAT s Tefl, ST aenreiT Hedadl a1 gie (Qer
(qTETRA- 1) AT Teaadt (FRIF TerTdT) TTSTHH AT FeAAAT (TR FRIF TLATAT) TTSTHA AT TeATAT
qTEIFHH g TSeeihd 9T, THT ordi & A= T@d gu, ST 9ug gT fafae @it S, gegadl aier §
I o forw 97 g |
(3) FeTadT TreAT & HIs Tvfi UHT e T {1 0, ST T0E g7 q9T-987 9% 7aa & S0 &7
STT &9 goTE =93 | SATerh Agl gl |
TR UHT FE T, ST 9T | e Hare ¥ T 8, UHT 6 T §a19 HT, S IRug g7 99d-987
¥ g Y 5w
(4) Tt averT o Tt srerefl o aivere gy HHT-aHT 9 T ATATRT TIE=AT *h STTHTE et o
STTOSAT 1"
1. RFEFw 29 #, 3u-faf==w (2) & w=rq, Ratated su-faf==m (3) sia:eaaa T S, saiq-
"(3) = fat=wT # siafaw freft o ara & gra gu off, uhug, fafFaw 295 ¥ srefia wreaa qreasH & fou
TSI ST B9 & THT, ST &l JadTse 9T U gadT ST &3 o (A aq & Fefiq wreaad
qTSIH & forT Tforedisreor &7 &g ¥ qeT 1"

12.  faffaw 299 37 297 71 A0 BT SO |




6 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART 1I—SEC.4]

13.  fafqgw 299 #, su-faffaw (2) % wanq Fafieg su-EfRaw (3) saenfia e ST,
ERIGE

"(3) == fafaawt & siafdy Gl ara ¥ gra gu off, afug, ffRem 299 % swefia wreaer oher siw g &
TET =9 FARaH % Tefi7 wreaer qEear F SIS 7 9 FT Tl 3 A IAAT 7 7g 0T it S[rusft
7 T = 31(v) % e 9-99T 9% 9RUg g1 TAT ATHITGT TTST=AT & ATHT RIead Trear 3o
1"

14. fafRm 297 % e Mefofeg BfRaw 29 v 299 siaeaniaq fFFu STus, sraiq -

"29%. TS TTSAFH & [oTT TISTEL 0 ST e

(1) T B arveff &, S = Rt & oedfim gegadt odver st 6 €, 72 s £ Sl & 92
ST TTSIHH g TIoreed HY :

g U Fre e, Rree == ARt F srefie sretora qewteti| wegadt aiver a7 gid forar (adier-
1) =T FeAAAT (FFeTF TEAAAT) TLAT AT HEAAAT (Tehigha Jielh TETHAT) TLAT AT HEAAAT TLIEAT ST 30l
g, o =71 afF=et %y g #T aE F RIEAd IS0 g oreel qgl 44T g, 39 A=t & o+
ST F FATATAT & AT T2 gU RIEAA TTSIHH o {10 TRELIHTOT Zq TT 2T

g T oY T UAT FIE v efl, ST uge F gf =4 AHIwi % orefi| wreAd qreawmy & o TR g,
T orqt o otefi Tgd gu, ST ahug gy A= fEe $t ST, wreaa qreaswd § §uiadd &g a1 g6 |

(2) A qTEFH & o TeEEia srerdT TR T AT T § SATAaH & 912 UHT e & a1
T, ST TG FTT HHI-THT 9 Haq 6T ST {7 ST AT oI &0 8 ATEF Tl g

T UAT HI5 AEAT, ST AT | a1 (Hard F¥ ¥l 8, UHT I T §a1d HT, ST TRug g1 F0-997
¥ g Y 5w

(3) =m0 Ttz & srefimr FoReft srereft a1 Tiowdisreor, 3o Teredu/aaiiaay i e o &9 a9 6T
st & forw fEfemT= grm

g Fe AT IHF FIT TRUE FIT AGHIRT T&T § A& T&qd (oh0 AT 9% JAT UHT FIF F7 T8
R0 ST 9%, ST 9ROE g0 q9-H9T 9Y A q i 1, 9 99 A o0 7 satey & O e U e O
fafemTsr & forw o= g |

299 WA TLEAT H T

(e 31(v) % srefim afvws gT SAqAed area=ar & dAeiT wreaa a0 § 550 ard T¥atidr fit
]
(1) T=reft oft srerefT 1 O T BreAd GLrET | Agl dod &F7 STuar S ae o6-

() TE FTAA ITSTHH g Tweihd 7 gl A I8+ AT 285 % T AT Teaadt Terer & a1
THET T ITAMOT A AT 3T 5

(ii) S| 39 7T T, EH G F SIS AT ST 8, Tgel aiiE o 0F 9867 & ®9 H 99T F o0
o7 TUTerT 0 T FH I ATH F AN LH T HT 927 7 FFFam 2 ;

(i) SO AF=E® 51T & 9 A\ a1 A=A T aife FqdAl qael Thigd qIeIHd ol
AFHAATIEF I F FT w21 ;

(iv) A= AT\ 517 & AT Fq-Tq9 T ATATST AISLAT T IAT T AL AT T 5 3T

(v) SH THT 317 SAU&AT3A I UHT T & T 7 F2 o =T g, S IRuE g0 997-997 92 A= iEs &t 9 |




[\ 1H—ETE 4] T T TSI © T 7

(2) su-faff=w (1) & siafae et oF a1a & gra gu ff, UH et sreneft, S =9 Rt % o
TSI Fiereh 90T (T0eaT- 1) AT Fierss TerHar qer I7 Tahiha i aersdr TLrar a1 qeqadi (Fh
TETAAT) TEEAT AT HEAAAT (THRIFA Jreidh TATAT) THAT T TLIAAT TLAT IAMT 6l g AT ATee AHTSec
T, 1964 F srefim wegadt o a1 91 srehtsee fAfRaw, 1949 % srefiwr wreaer wterr <ot i g
77 o 39 fAfFeet % srefim woaw afier s<hh 3 & ge wam Ay T off, 7 wreAe ader #§ g9 i
FIATT & SATUIAT 93] Tg Toh I IH T o0l Tgell arrg &, e arer &7 s Fhar ST 8, 985
FE T H TAM ITH FF F o0 To7 uferq sragrieas giereror q@r < forar g1 a7 ag e gg = a
ST TTAET0T 92T 2T 2T 21, o siqsta faff=m 50 F srefi= e snferr gy, afw g 21, ofr 2
ST 38 = TATH=ET & oe a1 ITFT 7 AT AT 2T |

TrSTRTOT—UE et srerefT &, S =9 fAfF=et F 93 g9 & 0@ wreAe T § do i STAd & dr
T oft, T eAr A STt o ag AfHa 517 % ofefi9 g=AT STl 3T A% HI9el F Sared TR
THIFT TSTHT AT T 2 Ja7 AT 519 F qdfim wa-faefie siaarea aisgat w1 Sl &3 qor
HEITT T TIEAAT g SNAGT Feed § T UHT 77 THT TTATA 7 UHT ATq § AT &Y, ST TRUE T
Tag-rag g7 AfREs fir s )

15. =1 fafa=i % fafaaw 30 % v o= ferfaa e war srosm, st -

"30. FIEAS ILIEAT % THT THGT AT Fad Tk THg H a5 AT e srvgfi THT B FT G20 FHAMT e
Tug FRT A9F-A97 9 Faa 3T ST oY ST 9 g9 ®90 & S{ee gl gl

T UET HIS A¥AT, ST AT | a1 (Har] F¥ ¥l 8, UHT I &7 §a1d HT, ST 7Rug g7 F0-997
¥ g i 5w )

16. AA=H 31 & @< (i) 3T (iii) FT AT BHAT ST &7 @ (iv) F T4 FaEfated g (v) daend
ERISIIRERI

"(v) TafRa® 28 % e Heqadl qTSawA gq ATHHT YA 9 & TETq THI-987T 9 IS FET T4q7
FIAIET ITSTFAT & ATE 17|

17. fafa=m 32 ¥, "soreeiee &9 & AT" 9051 & TATG "SA=TAT" €068 i eqToq oA ST |

18. fafeaw 365 =1 o9 fohaT STTUAT |

19. fafa=w 367 & Iu-fata=w (1) F w9 w7, FRHferia ST-[fF=E (1) 7@ ST, &690q -

"(1) T Bt sreefT % "ay @, S BfREw 259 F i wrssam whem & don f iy & wE g,
AT Fg =FUq a1 ST o 399 36 90T S0 &7 Af g T(Q 98 UF of T8 | T3 [@aug #
AT AT TS TIALTT 31 T FaT g 7 aeft ot #§ $o e =mas 7= gfaed s e Far
21"l

20. fafq=w 36@ * warq Meferiaa ffaaw 367 sia:earfua fFar Sroam, oriq -

"36T. TSI TLEAT IO L o 1T STqeAT

[FafR=w 255 F el wrSS e TEeT § S a1l A4 F7 a0

(1) TH et rwrefT & 999 §, ™o AFEm 255 % el wreeee ader # a9 #iF ot & 1€ g,
AT T Fua /AT ST & 389 39 90T Sl T off 8 Jis 98 U of 9419 § i &6ud §
IATH THATE TTAeTd 3 T FLar g |

(2) afiug et Ao o o7-97 A7 TI-=1 H, BAd aeq=s T & $o7 ategterq g, THr A, ST 999-
Ty o7 AREy i STu, T s 7 5 taT "Tee i SIE T et 1"

21. fafaas 377 1 & fowa stroa |




8 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART 1I—SEC.4]

22. fafe=w 37+ ¥, of i & Taq Meferted sia e T ST, o0 -

"[FATH=w 28 % AT TeAad qLreT § 954 aTer e 9 o forg A" |

23. [afe=w 379 & T, Motortad Afaaw 37 sia:eaiua o stroam, st -

"37%. HEAAT TLAT ATV el Harelt ATy

[T 2851 % srefier weaadT odvear & S arer sreta & forw &

(1) Fr2 vt @9 | 97 99E || § 9% €9 § 97 UF 97 96 G607 A1 a8 992 | A1 99 || & IO+ % °e
FT girgferg #:3a ar et AR A 9 T |

(2) T srerefT T SR 39 F9T FeAadl GLrET R IAM0 Fed arer oo gff & =7 § =iva &
ST TR a8 99g | 3 99g I, <=1 § I grar g |

(3) IS AVAT IH THT FAT AG T Tgag THTITI o folT 9T gHIT Tfa-

(F) g FeTAT T % 99z | 3T T9qg |, T H 37T FaT g

(@) @8 fafqaw 519 % stefiq g=a SRl sfiT 9 Frerei Gadt Thrhd TeaHA w ThAdTgaT T
FTATE ;

(1) ag = ARTHT § 79T ITETAT ATFGIE TIAAT Hl T FAT S ;

() 98 =7 AT # T97 ITATad F-rfaefie At AisIAl il ahaAargas 20 HaT 8 ;

(F) 98 THT FIF FT 92T FAT 8, S IR g7 997-997 9¢ Faq &1 70 $fi7 S 9= g9 299 7
arfers Al gl

g UET FrE sreref, S Ared ¥ argY T T g, U fr o7 Herr w9, S a9-a9 97 aiive g
o i o S

(=) TET S seedt, e = ARt a1 9 sersde AR, 1964 % el a7 av wegadt afer av
HEAAAT (ThTeha JIereh TeATAT) TLIEAT AT Thihd Fiieh TeATAT TLAT AT HeAAAT (FIxreh Teq9ar) TLET AT
i TEAAAT TAT T Fiareh TAeAT-11 TeqT T TehTe e Heqadi qerear 3oy = g a7 5| =1ee siarsee
fafe=m, 1949 F stefie weaadT a1 To® qLrer A0 A7 8 A7 o 37 By & qefie sy afvear s<hor
LA AT AT Ge T il e AT AT ISF SAaiene Tehet 1ol STHTOTTS S&TF Ag! hAT 47 AT, THT =T SATEAT3,
ST 9Rug T FHT-g9T Y [AeE & 10, F AT 9 FRAT Adihd dgds THTTA 3 Ardad
T o forT qrr g |

(4) TrET sregeff o Haer § AT 39 99T T ATI0IT 6T SO 136 ST THRATT AT THE H1 A H7
(F) 98 UF & TIE § THEI, F7q 998 | 3T 99 || F To4F WF-07 § IAqH AT 16 JTa9ra 30 q
FIAT & 3T THF THg F T TI-TAT 5 A Sl o IAdH TATH TA9T 30 I F2aT g ; AT

(@) 98 TF o TAE § Tz, AT T | 3% a9z || F T&F T0-99 § AqH =119 Tiaerd i I
FIAT g 3T AT THGT o6 THT TT-T3 6 T SAF[ o ~qAqH TATE T 3 I FLav g |

(5) Toreft sTvrdT o warer &, TATiRATd, Jg A9 3T TR AT AT 73 399 79 | a1 79 | 1 THe AT
3T 2 Torar g Af% a8 us g7 YW § "9E AT IME F TAF TI-UT H FqAGH AT T(aerd dF qT
FIAT & ST 39 THE AT e & T TI-TAT 6 FeA 31 o IAdH T TA9T 3 ST Feam g |

(6) THET FIe srvrefl, e == AfFaHT % eI smaforg Hegadi airer # 1 gl | 7 el UF 998
T IT oA & T ST SRl & ST Agl AT § AT S Hegadi (Tehishd i Teqear) Ter av
THIFd FRE TARAT THAT AT Tt (Frow TATdT) TLAT A7 Fiaw fqeAr (afeAr-1l) AT aorre
HEAAAT TLAT &l IATO (R AT &, IH THT ITeh STANRT 7 TohT TT STGE AT SAFE o [T T TT-T5
T -1 & e o [T FHaTE g [T, T3 TeHA TA-07 TR FIRT AqHANGT A% Ia=9dT H 2@ T g |




[\ 1H—ETE 4] T T TSI © T 9

(7) afeaz TRt steredT &1 T o7-97 a1 -1 § g TS 0 ST & ST @ & o fRemtaaer
faef=ra T gl Tt UHT &l g 93 § =9 A==t % e st qegadt adar § Suanr 9 /o 1o
TEATT TF-T AT TI-T30 | Fe & Faa T Jq9, SaH a9 ge Aa it g, IQ Toqaq= w-07
fafaaw 2871 & Sufafa=w (4) & srehie afiug g srgeTfead 4 area=at § fGeme . 8 | 0F JoHT 94-
T T WF-TAT =0, Sieg ST e | a8 AAFA W@l &, THATAl | dod I IH I ILrearsqi § 39 997
AT =To Rt STosT 3fe 38 U Jome § UH A $F-07 I -0 #, SEH ag @ # S0 g o
THRA TET 9T, qATH ATAH TTAAT 3 TTH FAT & ST THE 6 THT TA-TAT & T Sl o FAqTH TATH
STeTd ST T ITH FaT &, ST siavid UF o7-97 AT -7 & 3 o7 &, o 389 0@ § vhug grr g2
T T TS AT

(8) Iu-Tafe=w (1) & (5) # siafae T aTad & 2 gu Wl &rs srvefT, ST7 fohelt |z a7 gf+e & afeafaq
TAT T7-T31 T TOHATHA | q27 § ST 9 U AT ATerF TA-TA1 H SAqA07 g g, v et g & afewfora
g Tohg 39 39 @9g & Tl wo1-97 a1 fhegl TI-931 § ~qAqH 1% IIaerd i 976 0 g, UH 00-97 a1
TF-931 T, ™EH 399 91 uided ¥ #79 &iF i R g, anmHT d9 adyeret § G uw ar atew
TATSAT § T o 7T 9757 R | 3/ 39 99 AT (A< § IO AU 3T ST A1 T8 UF of TIT |
AT TA-TF § FAqH AT A 3 TTH FAT @ i 39 T4 AT (e % AT TI-T3A1 6 T il 6
AT TATEH TALT Sl A I FaT g, SFH U w7-97 ot qieaferg g, 5 3a9+9 oaw [Afee #
qEAdl THEAT | =AAH |18 Tiaerd st ST 0 o | 98 39 48 AT LA & AT -9 IT T9-T31 § a9
T RN T T e o ForT oTe 981 T 5T a o SO 39 99z AT A § IH 98 F HeZ &l 15 ge
T 07 T 7 33T foram 2 |

(9) =t FreT srerfT 7 37 FAfF= (8)  oreli™ 38 He[X &iT TS ge &1 Ul wEaT 337 o T ¢ 37 a8 S 998
T e FT A FXd H THA Al gl TT § df ag TATAad] TLATA § Ih G I AT 7@ & [@aehed o
TERATT | TAT, THT TRt @9 & UF o7wrefT & 75 o9t 7 STustt o a8 S9 99 a7 IAe & a9 TI-0 & |
T § ~ATH TATH T 30 TTH L qTih 3H 39 Tz AT Il H ITT =i 6T ST 86 |

(10) wfvwz oH T Ta-957 a1 wr-a= §, B aeqEs 9w F vy gt gia g, UE Gf9 §
THRTLTCHS 3 o TS T (04T Ty, Star o wag-vag a7 f{fRfEs frar s

24. fafagw 38 =iiw 387 &1 <19 a7 SITUw |

25. fafeaw 389 #, ofti= & TeTq, Mt sia:eamaa Bham STos, v -

"R 31(iv) F o1l TRUE T AR qTea=Al & AT wread qer § g7 Tl AEIriAr &
ferm =

26. Fafe=w 38% & TTq, Mofoted fafaaw 38 sia:earfud foham SIToem, - ererie -

"t 31(v) F Tefi TRus ZIRT AqHIST TST=aT & STefe B G § 95 a7l A ATAAT & o0
AT

(1) FrE srereff /9 | 97 |92 |1 7 aeqrst a1 6t vF gfae it aiverst |, e uhary 9398 | 91 998
I % T7-9=71 % He AieAtad g a7 el U aqg/aMe i UF 9097 § 93 T 3 919 g7 A7 99g/3He
T TLIATSAT H I3 TRT AT SH AT ST 7T I TUHAT I A qTel 77T o €T § =iioa
ToFaT SO IfT 38 ST Jgt A ST T T gl

(2) Treft sTeredT o Saer § HrHaa: 39 87T T AU AT ST o 39, TATreta, a1 aqgi/amet
T THETT I 2 foram g, Afe-

(F) a8 UF B TIE § THI/IFEr & TAF: TF-T | IAdH ATAH ITA90d 3 ITH Fqm g A Tah
/A & a9t TI-T31 % FATH TATH TIAAT i I ITH FHar g ; AT

(@) a8 AT T/ F T4F TI-T5 | TF of TATH H FAqH FATAE TA90d 3 T FaT g i a0
TRI/AAET o THT TT-TAT 6 S(hl 6 Tl AN o ~ATH TATH T 3(hT Hl ITH FAT 2 |




10 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART 1I—SEC.4]

(3) ToRelt srerefT 1 ol &g/aMe & 39 997 ST =uq T ST I3 98 & &f 999 § 39
/AT F TAF TA-T § AqH AT TTAAqT FFHT H I FAT g 3T 39 g/ Ae & T T0-1
% Tl ST oF IATH TATH TIAIT iRl T TTH FAT 8 |

(4) T B vrefl, e BRI 31 % @ (iv) F 9 afiog g SR et % aefie wreae
Tt & TRt U i o 3t awgi/Afer # i s<hor G g A few w9l sersde fafaam, 1988 &
ATAT '@ F T 3 AT 97 3F T AT qTSAFAT F SAAAE FEAA THAT AT FEIAT THT I TG ATES
FFT3ee fafqaw, 1964 & SqEHAT @@ & T 3 & efid wreAdr qear (1 Saa<t 1985 F T=Tq &l
qgi/AMeEt et =h) w3 A g, 39 fAtirs ag/afte @ ge % o ur R siw 39 g auterd
BRI T a8 wreae qireT I e o o0 0w "ag/afe & 0T § 95 3fT 39 I Y |

(5) ufeas FoReT steredT &1 R So7-ao7 =T Wo-a § g2 e R S T ST @ o forg fRemtaaer
ot e aait afe Ut e ge 1@ # A 31 % @2 (iv) & sefia smanfora ofter & s 7 fF o
TEATT TF-T AT TI-T51 | Fe & da8< T Aq93, oad 399 ge Afoa it g, I aoasw= w1-7
fafRee 31(v)  erefie TRug 1T AqHITRT RIEAS TLAT S 7 Te=A1 # fQ=dwm 8 | UH JqwHe 94
T AT TA-T301 =0, [Sivg IO Feed H a8 ATFA L@l &, THEATA H To I IH IH TLeATA H I 9077
ST =TT 7T SO 318 38 U J3me | UH A -0 7 -1 |, 59 ag @ # S| g |
FHRA TET AT, qATH FATATH TTAAT 3 TTH FAT § AT THE 6 THT TA-TAT % T Sl 6 FATH TATE
TS ST T ITH AT &, oreeh siavid UH T7-957 AT TA-TA1 & 3 AT 8, oH 39 0@ § 7Rug g g2
&I T T o |

(6) Iu-fafa=w (1) & (5) # siafae et a1d & rd gy AT &re sreaeff, S Foheft |a9g a7 giHe & afeafaa
TAT TF-T31 6T THATHA H 927 § 3T ag T AT ATeF TA-TA1 H A7 gal &, 1 et oo | afewfera
g o 39 39 @Hqg & Tt woa-a=1 a1 fhegl T7-930 § ~qAaH J1 Jiaerd &6 Ire 0 8, U 550-97 a1
TF-T=1 FT, e S |1 widerd ¥ w9/ 3w w8, smmHT o aferet § R v a7 stfee
TATSAT § T o 7T 9751 SR | I/ 37 9 AT (A< § I =0T 6T SITUAT AT q8 TF of TIH H
TAF -0 § AqH ATAH TAd 3 TTH FAT g 3 39 99 AT (Ae % THT TI-T31 6 T il 6
IATH TATE T T 0 TTH FAT g, SAH U $1-07 AT Gt g, v 394 3w [{fde #
TEAdT AT | =IATH |15 Tae0d i I8 60 o | 98 39 948 AT A< & AT TT-97 AT TF-00 § a9
e o feT =T ge & o o a8t g S 3% 6 3H 39 99 a1 I § 39 T8 § {9 A TS ge
T O TTIaT 7 337 forar 2r |

(7) =t TRt srereff = 37 fafaa (6)  efie I8 we[T 1 T 2 1 07 HrIaT Io7 o 2 3 a8 3 998
T e FT AT F4d H TRA Al gl THT § a7 a9 TETAad] TLATSA § ITh Fe I AT 7@ H7 Fshed of
TRATT | TATH, UHT FoReT 29 ® UH S7wefT & g ST9eAT f STusl o6 a8 39 99z a7 A< & O TI-41 § |
T § ~ATH TATH T i TTH L qTih 3H 39 Tz AT e H IT0T =i 6 ST a6 |

(8) afiwz UH farelt oI-ao AT -9 #, D aeq= s ThT & T eafed gid &, Uet Jid § T
I F [TASS T TIAT ToRAT, ST o wo-guy g2 fAfRfEy G s

27. [af=w 39 & Su-fafaaw (1) #, @< (F) & o X [efoiad @< (F) T@r ST, J9id-

"(F) TH TLAT o TOTH I HEATH i da€Tee 92 39asd wHerar s, S 77 suafda frar smon
o T S v I I § AT 18T ¢ AT e @ g ;"

28. fafaaw 40 #, 3u-fafa=w (1) F wae o= Rl safat=s (1) T@r ST, o9iq -

"(1) Rt OF sreredt &, S = RBfREEt F adi| st gegadt (Thiga gis gewarn) 97,
HEASAT TLIEAT AT HISAA TLEAT ST 1 7, TRUE T ATHMGd T=T | T8 TAF AT TH T 95 TG
ERIESIRUE

g g T srerefl ST UET THIOI T&T 3 § SHIT HT Gl ST Rreae aedT S0 6 ol §
g =7 AT & o= UH Ul FT AqUTAT Al (03T ¢, FSAFRT AqITe HeT9 FT &€ a9 & o
CIECIRER




[\ 1H—ETE 4] T T TSI © T 11

T T ST fF F esrenff aRug gy auT-a9y 9T qATA ey aEEt # @ F SN J@iad
EaE THTIIT g A& HT T 1"

29. fafaTw 45 & 3u-fafa=w (1) .-
(i) @< (F) ¥, "AfHTw 43" o7 ST il & TAT, "6 A= H T@d gU” A58 QA7 o o,

(i) Sw-ffa=w (1) & @< (@)(i) 7, "A=IT 28 F" 91531, Sl 3T eI & T, "1 A=IH 28T *
T AT HeTadt qLreAT  JA1 GHEl" 9768, dF ¥ AT qTI1iaa oo S

30. fafe=w 48 & 3u-fafa=w (1) #, FFemm gt F v o Feferfa aroft Wit ST, sraiq -

gt

AMfemhoe TEIF i AT 6 AT T HT | TIH a9 & TIAAT | TAC a9 6 TAAT | T9C a9 F
FR(TRTT EARaE] I sfereqr % R

(1) 2) (3) 4)
(i) S 9T A7 srfaen fr STeEEAr arer | €.4000/- %.5000/- %.6000/-
EAVALIES
(ii) =" =TT ST gEE wteek e e @ | £.3000/- %.4000/- %.5000/-
T FH T TAEEIT AT MZL/ATT
(i) o= @M" ¥ FH AT JEGEAT ATl | €.2000/- %.3000/- %.4000/-
EAVALIES
31. AfH=T® 50 9 -

(i) e (i) ®, " " 9Teal F T U< ST A 9e8 ¥ S0

(ii) @ (i) & T & eI 9 Feierfad wiqs T@r S, 69iq -
‘o UET FE Avrefl, B A sl (gAY Herae) fafaaw, 2022 % y9w g1 # @
A= e &t srafyr  forw anfises A & &7 # Toree o w7 o, sfereor & ST w8

H oATT Rt ST U A T ad g0 24 [AWFAl & fefia [Hoaraa snféswes oo F
ATETT SATAGTH TTACAV T AT AT HT T L@ ST IH T FEA & (1T T AT 1)

32. fafq=w 51 -
(i) SY-faf==® (1) ¥, ""egadl 70T Rl & TETq T AHAAl F A" orex e
TR ST T "STSTRE ATH" 9Teai o €79 9% "91g A" 9768 T ST ;
(i)  Iu-fafaEm (4) =T (9) #, "S5 A" 9Teal & €A I¥ "91g AIE" 8 T& STU ;
(i)  ST-FAFEE (1) #, "sf=Es ireor” o’ & TE, " Aaq U6 e w9 Ui 919 &
eI T2 g ASE ST [T ST ;
(iv)  Su-faf=w (11) % Terq, FRetateaa se-REEw (12) siaeaa B s, sr=iq -
“12. = afFaw & safee T a1 % a0 gu oft AT F15 aifédes 9g@®, ST A1ee Adldee (T

Terrge) fafaaw, 2022 F 99w g & aE & AT ITT T T2 gl AT TIAAT Y17 F =T &,
SYfA=H (6) F srefie fAoarfaa Tfererr F3T & ST ST Teveqor it 99 FAafer 7 AT T@ 37

T A o6 T 91 g 1"

33. @A77 517 &, "qeqadt UTSAFH " =T+ THAT, "q7 1" 957 I U=T A FF F TAA, A7 [{FATT
285 FN=, FeoaniRrta, "orsg, 3 A7 AeqT i e fFw sroay

34. fafagy 515 ¥, "sifaw a7 aul” 9sal & T U, "qard” oree ¥ "fAiaear & Frt off sraeme ¥ faer
9T&RT % TATT 9T "SfIT e TLEAT H 9o+ § 3" 951 T S0

35. fafiaw 51% & warq, Matateg GFfFaT 519 sia.eafua AT o, s -




12 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART 1I—SEC.4]

"519 FATAL AAATST TSI

(1) T Foreft srereff, o wegadt odeT & A1 J8gt & I w2 forT 8, | T8 Sr9eAr it Srustt & ag
ST ST H ATSIAT I AEATT Haed AT ¥ UHT Ofd 7, ST 9Rug grT aag-a97 72 afafae i s,
T AT ATAATSA HTSLAT T T FeI0T 37T Ivg, ST FHT |

(2) UF ToRHT sTendT o e | 39 99 A AU T SITUAT o ST ST SAATS AISLAT T AT
T forT g I1e a8 T AT § A T9TH TIa9rd sish I F:ar g 1"

36. fafe=w 54 & S9-fafA=w (5) #, "sTore" 958 F T U, "91g" 9758 L@ SITUAT |
37. fafe=w 54% & Taq Mafatea A= 54%a siaearfua o ST, srerie -

"S54z, UH FErAT T, T GG F A1 FaT8 FT @I 8, AT F JTgT Ak e AT EE F 9
qaeT % Jefe agTieen Jrareqor

THT FwE qeFdT, ST ARG F qeY Fa™ # W@ Y, IR ¥ a7g] AaUp Adsecd hede | FIRT
HTAATITE T ST= Sr@iehe SeATHI AT =Tl & 97 G241 o e UHr O |, ST TRug g7 Aaema
T ST, SATARTF T FT FAT 1"

38. fafa# 56 & IU-fAHFH (1) F TgT TLqF * w19 9 M fad Tqa Tar ST, TIid-

"o U AT o TR A9 H, TH TR AT ARl &, Afehos TG 3T IHh TLTT & S T
FTT FAATSI T FHTE BT ST HHAT | TTAAT F gEE A G, AT(CHAT 6 (AT ol FHH H] IH
T AT T AT AT IR sfewos Ag@T SN A0 w7 fGFeq ar g a1 sraaras
gt a7 Rafai # st vaT T s e, SET & 9iug g [t B s

39. Aaffaw 59 ¥, -
(i) ST-Fafa=w (1) & = o2 Fefeted e (1) T@r ST, e -
"(1) Eg;énsuﬁchvs TETIH AT ATARNH TIAAT % TedF a9 | aig a7 it gar & forw amr
"

(i) S-FAF=w (2), (4) 377 (5) FT AT AT SATUIT ;
(iii) ST-Fafe (7) %, -

(F) TTEHRIO (1) |, "GAAT ATAT TITA0r el qrenhd Sl QT e Y qgar
FITAT el ITSTFH" eTeal o I U< "ARTT 51F F a7 Iroahd” 9sa, i T Te%
T STO

(@) TSR (2) FT AT AT SATOIT ;
(iv) ST-Faf==w (7) & T, Fefofaa sa-Efaaw (8) siaeurtua T ST, steriq -

"(8) UHT FIE ATTETwoT AZTAH, ST ATeS AHT3ee (T "werrerd) fafazw, 2022 F wa g
T AT I TF T H T ahd g, 36 (S T & UF ITae] & AT grar T3, ST 396
HITE | I 999 J T A1 2t a8 27 At F srefiw oot snféser fFea sqam
ot et g 1"

|, (3T1.) ST THE 937, a4

[FrsTTa=T 111/4/318T./103/2022-23]

feoqur: w1 fAfF=w, W & T, S|, A 1 S, 1988 Fr sfeg=eT |@edr 1-61u(7)134/88,
T 1 SA, 1988 & FWRT YHIAA [T U o ST TAH Sifqd Herge Sfeeg=eT dedr

1-H1(7)/198/2021 F HTeAT T AT TAT AT, [T AT F TSI, ST, TG 7 |41, 2022
H TRTIATT g3 AT




[\ 1H—ETE 4] T T TSI © T 13

THE INSTITUTE OF CHARTERED ACCOUNTANTS OF INDIA
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 2nd June, 2022

No. 1-CA(7)/201/2022.—The following draft of certain regulations further to amend the Chartered
Accountants Regulations, 1988, which the Council of the Institute of Chartered Accountants of India
proposes to make, is hereby published, as required by sub-section (3) of section 30 of the Chartered
Accountants Act, 1949 (38 of 1949) for the information of all persons likely to be affected thereby; and
notice is hereby given that the said draft regulation shall be taken into consideration after the expiry of a
period of thirty days from the date on which the copies of the Gazette of India, in which these draft
regulations are published, are made available to the public;

Any person desiring to make any objection or suggestion in respect of the said draft regulations,
may forward the same to the Council of the Institute of Chartered Accountants of India within the period so
specified addressed to the Secretary, the Institute of Chartered Accountants of India, ICAI Bhawan,
Indraprastha Marg, New Delhi — 110 002;

Any objection or suggestion which may be received from any person with respect to the said draft
regulations before the expiry of the period so specified shall be taken into consideration by the Council.

Draft Regulations

I @ These regulations may be called the Chartered Accountants (2" Amendment) Regulations,
2022.

(2) They shall come into force on the date of their final publication in the Official Gazette.
. In the Chartered Accountants Regulations, 1988, -

1. In Regulation 5, after clause (a) of sub-regulation (1), the following proviso shall be inserted,
namely,-

“Provided a person who has completed his practical training under regulation 54AA shall not be entitled to
have his name entered in the register of Member until and unless he has fulfilled the additional eligibility
criteria as specified by the Council from time to time”;

2. In Regulation 9, for sub-regulation (1), the following shall be substituted, namely :-

“(1) A member may apply to the Council for a certificate entitling him to practise as a chartered
accountant.

Provided that a person who has been admitted as a member at any point of time shall be eligible for
certificate of practice on completion of one year of post qualification work experience with a fellow
Chartered Accountant in Practice.

Provided further that the requirement of one year post qualification work experience shall not be applicable
for a member who has worked for a minimum period of one year with a fellow Chartered Accountant in
Practice in the immediately preceding five years before the date of making such application.”

3. Regulations 25C and 25D shall be omitted;
4. In Regulation 25E, after for sub-regulation (2), the following sub-regulation (3) shall be inserted,
namely :-

“(3) Notwithstanding anything contained in these regulations, the Council may, after the commencement of
registration for the Foundation Course under regulation 25G, discontinue registration of the Foundation
Course under this regulation by notice in the website of the Institute.”

5. In Regulation 25F, after for sub-regulation (3), the following sub-regulation (4) shall be inserted,
namely :-

“(4) Notwithstanding anything contained in these regulations, the Council may, after the commencement of
the Foundation Examination under Regulation 25H, discontinue holding the Foundation Examination under
this regulation and the candidates shall be required to pass the Foundation Examination as per the syllabus
approved by the Council from time to time under regulation 25H.”;



14 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART 1I—SEC.4]

6. After Regulation 25F, the following regulations 25G and 25H shall be inserted, namely :-
“25G. Registration for the Foundation Course

(1) No candidate shall be registered for the Foundation Course unless he has passed the Class 10"
Examination conducted by an examining body constituted by law in India or outside India an examination
recognised by the Central Government or the State Government as equivalent thereto.

(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-regulation (1), a candidate who was already registered for
Common Proficiency Course or Foundation Course under these regulations shall be eligible for conversion
to Foundation Course under this regulation subject to such conditions as may be specified by the Council.

(3) The registration for Foundation Course shall be valid only for a period of four years from the date of
registration / conversion.

(4) A candidate shall pay such fee, as may be fixed by the Council from time to time, which shall not
exceed twenty-five thousand rupees, along with an application in the form approved by the Council for
registration to the Foundation Course.

Provided a candidate who is residing outside India shall pay such fees as may be fixed by the Council from
time to time.

25H. Admission to the Foundation Examination, Fee and Syllabus
(1) No candidate shall be admitted to the Foundation Examination unless he -

(@) is registered with the Board of Studies of the Institute for a minimum period of four months on or before
the 1% day of month in which the examination is held and has complied with such other requirements as
may be decided by the Council from time to time; and

(b) has appeared in the Senior Secondary (10+2) examination conducted by an examining body constituted
by law in India or outside India an examination recognised by the Central Government or the State
Government as equivalent thereto for the purpose of admission to graduation course.

(2) A candidate for the Foundation examination shall pay such fees, as may be fixed by the Council, which
shall in any case not exceed ten thousand rupees.

Provided a candidate who is residing outside India shall pay such fees as may be fixed by the Council from
time to time.

(3) A candidate for the Foundation examination shall be examined in the syllabus approved by the Council
from time to time.”;

7. Regulations 28D and 28E shall be omitted:;
8. In regulation 28F, after sub-regulation (6), the following sub-regulation (7), shall be inserted,
namely :-

“(7) Notwithstanding anything contained in these regulations, the Council may, after the commencement of
registration for the Intermediate Course under regulation 28H, discontinue registration for the Intermediate
Course under this regulation by notice in the website of the Institute.”

9. In regulation 28G, after sub-regulation (4), the following sub-regulation (5), shall be inserted,
namely :-

“(5) Notwithstanding anything contained in these regulations, the Council may, after the commencement of
Intermediate Examination under regulation 281, discontinue holding the Intermediate Examination under
this regulation and the candidates shall be required to pass the Intermediate Examination as per the syllabus
approved by the Council from time to time as per regulation 281.”;

10. After Regulation 28G, the following regulations 28H and 251 shall be inserted, namely :-
“28H. Registration for Intermediate Course and Fees

“(1) The study course for the chartered accountancy candidates shall be named as Intermediate Course,
which shall be composed of two Groups viz. Group | and Group II.

(2) No candidate shall be registered for the Intermediate Course unless he has passed the Foundation
Examination under these regulations and Senior Secondary (10+2) examination conducted by an examining



[\ 1H—ETE 4] T T TSI © T 15

body constituted by law in India or outside India or an examination recognised by the Central Government
or the State Government as equivalent thereto for the purpose of admission to graduation course and has
complied with such other requirements as may be decided by the Council from time to time.

Provided that a candidate who has passed the Entrance Examination or erstwhile Foundation Examination
or Professional Education (Examination — I) or Common Proficiency Test or Foundation Examination
under these regulations shall be eligible for registration to Intermediate Course under this regulation subject
to such conditions as may be specified by the Council.

Provided further that a candidate who was already registered for erstwhile Intermediate or Professional
Education (Course-1l) or Intermediate (Professional Competence) Course or the Intermediate (Integrated
Professional Competence) Course or the Intermediate Course under these regulations shall be eligible for
conversion to Intermediate Course under this regulation subject to such conditions as may be specified by
the Council.

(3) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-regulation (2), a graduate or post graduate as referred to in
sub-clause (ix) of regulation 2(1) shall be eligible for registration to Intermediate Course, if such person
isa-—

(a) graduate or post graduate in commerce having secured in aggregate a minimum of fifty five per cent. of
the total marks or its equivalent grade in the examination conducted by any recognised university
(including Open University) by studying any three papers each carrying a minimum of fifty marks in a
semester or year and cumulatively hundred or more marks over the entire duration of the concerned course,
out of the subjects i.e., Accounting, Auditing, Mercantile laws, Corporate laws, Economics, Management
(including Financial Management), Taxation (including Direct Tax Laws and Indirect Tax Laws), Costing,
Business Administration or Management Accounting or similar to the title of these papers with different
nomenclatures, as approved by the Board of Studies of the Institute; or

(b) graduate or post graduate other than those referred to in clause (a), having secured in aggregate a
minimum of sixty per cent. of the total marks or its equivalent grade in the examination conducted by any
recognised university (including Open University).

Explanation—For the purpose of this sub-regulation -

(i) for calculating the percentage of marks, the marks secured in subjects in which a person is required by
the University (including Open University) to obtain only pass marks and for which no special credit is
given for higher marks, shall be ignored; and

(ii) any fraction of half or more shall be rounded up to the next whole number and any fraction of less than
half number shall be ignored.

(4) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-regulation (2), a candidate who is pursuing the final year of
graduation / post graduation course shall be eligible for provisional registration to the Intermediate Course
which shall be confirmed only on submission of satisfactory proof of having passed the graduation / post
graduation examination with the minimum marks as provided in sub-regulation (3) of this regulation before
making the application for admission to Intermediate Examination;

Provided further that if candidates fail to secure minimum marks as provided in sub-regulation (3) of this
regulation before making the application for admission to Intermediate Examination, his provisional
registration shall be cancelled and for the purpose of these regulations —

(i) no credit shall be given for the theoretical education undergone; and

(ii) the Council may on receipt of an application from a candidate who is unable to produce the satisfactory
proof referred to in this regulation, permit refund of such amount of registration and tuition fee, as may be
decided by it from time to time.

Provided that a candidate who has already been granted the provisional registration under regulation 28F on
or before the coming into force of this regulation shall be required to submit the satisfactory proof of
having passed the graduation examination within such period not exceeding six months as may be decided
by the Council, from the date of appearance in the final year graduation examination.

Provided further that if candidates fails to produce the proof within the aforesaid period, his provisional
registration shall be cancelled and for the purpose of these regulations —



16 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART 1I—SEC.4]

(i) no credit shall be given for the theoretical education undergone; and

(ii) the Council may on receipt of an application from a candidate who is unable to produce the satisfactory
proof referred to in this regulation, permit refund of such amount of registration and tuition fee, as may be
decided by it from time to time.

(5) A candidate who has passed the Intermediate examination conducted by the Institute of Cost
Accountants of India set up under the Cost and Works Accountants Act, 1959 (23 of 1959) or by the
Institute of Company Secretaries of India set up under the Company Secretaries Act, 1980 (56 of 1980)
shall also be eligible for registration to Intermediate Course:

(6) A candidate for registration for Intermediate Course shall pay such fees as may be fixed by the Council
which shall not exceed twenty-five thousand rupees along with his application in the form as may be
approved by the Council.

Provided a candidate who is residing outside India shall pay such fees as may be fixed by the Council from
time to time.

(7) The registration of a candidate under this regulation shall be valid for a period of five years from the
date of registration/conversion

Provided that a candidate shall be eligible for a one time re-validation for a further period of five years on
his making an application in the form approved by the Council and on payment of such fee as may be fixed
by the Council from time to time.

(8) Notwithstanding anything contained in this regulation, a candidate registered for Intermediate Course
shall also be treated as having registered for-Business Accounting Associate also.

28l. Admission to the Intermediate Examination, Fees and Syllabus
[ Applicable to candidates registered for Intermediate Course under regulation 28H ]

(1) No candidate shall be admitted to the Intermediate Examination unless he is registered with the Board
of Studies of the Institute and produces a certificate to the effect that he has undergone a study course for
such period and in such manner as may be specified by the Council from time to time as on the first day of
the month in which the examination is held:

Provided that a candidate who is registered for the Intermediate Course under sub-regulation (3) of
regulation 28H shall be eligible for admission to the Intermediate examination on fulfilling of the following
criteria:-

(@) produce a certificate to the effect that he has undergone a study course for a period not less than eight
months, and;

(b) submission of satisfactory proof of having passed the graduation / post graduation examination with
the minimum marks as provided in said regulation before making the application for admission to
Intermediate Examination

(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-regulation (1), a candidate who was registered for the
erstwhile Intermediate or Professional Education (Course—Il) or Intermediate (Professional Competence)
Course or the Intermediate (Integrated Professional Competence) Course or the Intermediate Course shall
be eligible for admission to the Intermediate Examination subject to such conditions as specified by the
Council.

(3) A candidate for the Intermediate examination shall pay such fees, as may be fixed by the Council from
time to time, which shall not exceed ten thousand rupees.

Provided a candidate who is residing outside India shall pay such fees as may be fixed by the Council from
time to time.

(4) A candidate for the Intermediate Examination, shall be examined as per the syllabus approved by the
Council from time to time.”

11. In Regulation 29, - after sub-regulation (2), the following sub-regulation (3) shall be inserted,
namely :-



[\ 1H—ETE 4] T T TSI © T 17

“(3) Notwithstanding anything contained in these regulations, the Council may, after the commencement of
registration for the Final Course under regulation 29E, discontinue registration for the Final Course under
this regulation by notice in the website of the Institute.”

12. Regulations 29B and 29C shall be omitted:;

13. In Regulation 29D,-after sub-regulation (2), the following sub-regulation (3) shall be inserted,
namely,-

“(3) Notwithstanding anything contained in these regulations, the Council may, after the commencement of
the Final Examination under Regulation 29F, discontinue holding the Final Examination under this
regulation and the candidates shall be required to pass the Final Examination as per the syllabus approved
by the Council from time to time under regulation 31(v).”;

14. After Regulation 29D, the following regulations 29E and 29F shall be inserted, namely :-
“29E. Registration for Final Course and fees

(1) A candidate who has passed the Intermediate examination under these regulations shall be required to
register for the Final course:

Provided that a candidate who has passed the erstwhile Intermediate Examination or Professional
Education (Examination-11) or Intermediate (Professional Competence) Examination or the Intermediate
(Integrated Professional Competence) Examination or the Intermediate Examination held under these
regulations but has not registered for Final Course on the date of coming into force of these regulations
shall be eligible for registration to the Final Course subject to compliance with other provisions of these
regulations.

Provided further that a candidate who is already registered for Final Course under these regulations shall be
eligible for conversion to Final Course subject to such conditions as may be specified by the Council.

(2) A candidate for registration to the Final Course shall pay such fee as may be fixed by the Council from
time to time which shall not exceed forty thousand rupees along with an application in the Form approved
by the Councill.

Provided a candidate who is residing outside India shall pay such fees as may be fixed by the Council from
time to time.

(3) The registration of a candidate under this regulation shall be valid for a period of ten years from the
date of registration/conversion

Provided that a candidate shall be eligible for re-validation for a further period of ten years on his making
an application in the form approved by the Council and on payment of such fee as may be fixed by the
Council from time to time.

29F Admission to Final Examination

[Applicable to candidates appearing in Final Examination under the syllabus approved by the Council
under regulation 31(v)]

(1) No candidate shall be admitted to the Final Examination unless he —

(i) s registered for the Final Course and has passed both the Groups of the Intermediate Examination held
under regulation 28l; and

(if) has completed the practical training as required for admission as a member at least six months before
the 1% day of the month in which the examination is held; and

(iii) has successfully completed advanced Integrated Course on Information Technology and Soft Skills
under regulation 51E; and

(iv) has passed the self paced online modules as per regulation 51F; and

(v) has complied with such other requirements in such manner as may be specified by the Council from
time to time.

(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-regulation (1), a candidate who has passed the Professional
Education (Examination—II) or the Professional Competence Examination or the Integrated Professional
Competence Examination or the Intermediate (Professional Competence) Examination or Intermediate



18 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART 1I—SEC.4]

(Integrated Professional Competence) Examination or the Intermediate Examination held under these
Regulations or Intermediate Examination under the Chartered Accountants Regulations, 1964 or the
Intermediate or the first examination under the Chartered Accountants Regulations, 1949, or was exempted
from passing the first examination under those regulations shall be admitted to the Final examination
provided that he has completed the practical training as required for admission as a member or has been
serving the last six months of practical training, including excess leave, if any, under regulation 50 on the
first day of the month in which the examination is held and has complied with other provisions of these
regulations.

Explanation. - A candidate who has been admitted to the Final Examination before coming into force of
these regulations shall be required to complete the Advanced Integrated Course on Information Technology
and Soft Skills under regulation 51E and to pass the self-paced online modules under regulation 51F and
has complied with such other requirement in such manner as may be specified by the Council from time to
time before applying for membership of the Institute.

15. In regulation 30, for regulation 30, the following regulation shall be substituted, namely,-

“A candidate for admission to all the groups or only one group of the Final examination shall pay such fee
as may be fixed by the Council from time to time which shall not exceed ten thousand rupees.”;

Provided a candidate who is residing outside India shall pay such fees as may be fixed by the Council from
time to time.

16. In regulation 31, clauses (ii) and (iii) shall be omitted and after clause (iv), the following clasue (v)
shall be inserted, namely :-

“(v) as per the syllabus approved by the Council from time to time after commencement of enrolment to
Intermediate Course under regulation 28H.

17. In regulation 32, after the words “electronically or” the words “otherwise” shall be inserted.

18. Regulation 36A shall be omitted.;

19. In regulation 36B, -for sub-regulation (1), the following sub-regulation (1), shall be substituted,
namely,-

“(1) A candidate admitted to the Foundation Examination under Regulation 25F shall ordinarily be declared
to have passed the examination if he obtains at one sitting a minimum of forty per cent. marks in each paper
and a minimum of fifty per cent. marks in the aggregate of all the papers.”;

20. After regulation 36B, the following regulation 36C shall be inserted, namely,-
“36C. Requirement for passing the Foundation Examination
[Applicable to candidates appearing in Foundation Examination under Regulation 25H]

(1) A candidate admitted to the Foundation Examination under Regulation 25H shall ordinarily be declared
to have passed the examination if he obtains at one sitting a minimum of fifty per cent marks in each paper.

(2) The Council may adopt the criteria of negative marking in a paper or papers having objective type
guestions in such manner as may be specified by it from time to time.”;

21. Regulation 37C shall be omitted:;

22. In regulation 37D, after the heading the following shall be inserted, namely,-

“[Applicable to candidates who will be appearing in Intermediate Examination under Regulation 28G]”
23. After regulation 37D, the following regulation 37E shall be inserted, namely,-

“37E. Requirements for passing the Intermediate Examination

[Applicable to candidates appearing in Intermediate Examination under Regulation 281]

(1) A candidate may appear in Group | or Group I, separately or simultaneously or in a Unit comprising of
a set of papers of Group | or Group I1.

(2) A candidate shall ordinarily be declared to have passed the Intermediate Examination, if he passes in
both Group I and Group II.



[\ 1H—ETE 4] T T TSI © T 19

(3) A candidate, shall be eligible for Business Accounting Associate Certificate if he —
(2) passes both Group I and Group 11 of Intermediate Examination; and

(b) successfully completes Integrated Course on Information Technology and Soft Skills under regulation
51D; and

(c) completes the practical training as provided in these regulations; and
(d) successfully completes the self paced online modules as provided in these regulations; and

(e) pay such fees as may be decided by the Council from time to time which shall not exceed Rs five
thousand.

Provided a candidate who is residing outside India shall pay such fees as may be fixed by the Council from
time to time.

(f) A candidate, who has passed either the Intermediate Examination or Intermediate (Integrated
Professional Competence) Examination or Integrated Professional Competence Examination or
Intermediate (Professional Competence) Examination or Professional Competence Examination or
Professional Education-1I Examination or erstwhile Intermediate Examination under these regulations or
the Chartered Accountants Regulations, 1964 or Intermediate or the first examination under the Chartered
Accountants Regulations, 1949 or was exempted from passing the first examination under that regulation
have either been granted or not granted the Accounting Technician Certificate shall be eligible for making
an application for Business Accounting Associate Certificate on compliance with such other requirements
as may be specified by the Council from time to time.

(4) A candidate shall ordinarily be declared to have passed in both the Groups simultaneously, if he —

(a) secures at one sitting a minimum of forty per cent. marks in each paper of each of the Groups, viz.,
Group | and Group 11, and minimum of fifty per cent. marks in the aggregate of all the papers of each of the
Groups; or

(b) secures at one sitting a minimum of forty per cent. marks in each paper of both the Groups, viz., Group
I and Group 11, and a minimum of fifty per cent. marks in the aggregate of all the papers of both the Groups
taken together.

(5) A candidate shall be declared to have passed in Group | or Group Il or Unit, as the case may be, if he
secures at one sitting a minimum of forty per cent. marks in each paper of the Group or Unit and a
minimum of fifty per cent. marks in the aggregate of all the papers of that Group or Unit.

(6) A candidate, who has passed in any one but not in both the groups either of the Intermediate
Examination held under these regulations or Intermediate (Integrated Professional Competence)
Examination or Integrated Professional Competence Examination or Intermediate (Professional
Competence) Examination or Professional Education (Examination-11) or of the erstwhile Intermediate
Examination, shall be eligible for exemption in the corresponding paper or papers for the unexpired chance
or chances, if the corresponding paper or papers exists in the new syllabus approved by the Council.

(7) The Council may frame guidelines to continue to award exemption in a paper or papers to a candidate,
granted earlier in the Intermediate Examination held under these regulations for the unexpired chance or
chances of the exemption in the corresponding paper or papers, in which he has secured exemption if the
corresponding paper or papers exists in the new syllabus approved by the Council under sub-regulation (4)
of regulation 281. On appearing in the examination of the corresponding paper or papers in which he had
failed, he shall be declared to have passed the examination if he secures at one sitting a minimum of forty
per cent. marks in the corresponding paper or papers in which he had failed earlier and a minimum of fifty
per cent. marks in the aggregate of all the papers of the Group including the marks of the paper or papers in
which he had earlier been granted exemption by the Council.

(8) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-regulations (1) to (5), a candidate who has appeared in all
the papers comprised in a Group or Unit and fails in one or more papers comprised in a Group but secures a
minimum of sixty per cent. marks in any paper or papers of that Group shall be eligible to appear at any one
or more of the next three following examinations in the paper or papers in which he secured less than sixty
per cent. marks. He shall be declared to have passed in that Group or Unit if he secures at one sitting a
minimum of forty per cent. marks in each of such papers and a minimum of fifty per cent. of the total
marks of all papers of that Group or Unit including the paper or papers in which he had secured a minimum



20 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART 1I—SEC.4]

of sixty per cent. marks in the earlier examination referred to above. He shall not be eligible for any further
exemption in the remaining paper or papers of that Group or Unit until he has exhausted the exemption
already granted to him in that Group or Unit.

(9) If a candidate has exhausted the exemption granted to him under sub-regulation (8) and he was not able to
pass the said Group or Unit, he may opt for the continuing of said exemption to the subsequent examinations.
However, in such a case, such candidate shall be required to obtain a minimum of fifty per cent marks in each
of the remaining paper/s of that Group or Unit in order to declare him to have passed in that Group or Unit.

(10) The Council may adopt the criteria of negative marking in a paper or papers having objective type
questions in such manner as may be specified by it from time to time.”;

24, Regulations 38B and 38C shall be omitted:;
25. In regulation 38D, after the heading, the following shall be inserted, namely,-

“[Applicable to candidates appearing in Final Examination under the syllabus approved by the Council
under regulation 31 (iv)]”

26. After regulation 38D, the following regulation 38E, shall be inserted, namely, -

“[Applicable to candidates appearing in Final Examination under the syllabus approved by the Council
under regulation 31 (v)]

(1) A candidate may appear in Group | or Group Il or in a Unit comprising of a set of papers of Group | or
Group Il simultaneously or one Group/ Unit in one examination and the remaining Group / Unit and shall
ordinarily be declared to have passed the Final Examination if he passes in both the Groups.

(2) A candidate shall ordinarily be declared to have passed in both the Groups/Units as the case may be
simultaneously, if he —

(2) secures at one sitting a minimum of forty per cent. marks in each paper of each of the Groups/ Units and
minimum of fifty per cent. marks in the aggregate of all the papers of each of the Groups/ Units; or

(b) secures at one sitting a minimum of forty per cent. marks in each paper of both the Groups/Units and a
minimum of fifty per cent. marks in the aggregate of all the papers of both the Groups/Units taken together.

(3) A candidate shall be declared to have passed in a Group/Unit if he secures at one sitting a minimum of
forty per cent. marks in each paper of the Group/Unit and a minimum of fifty per cent. marks in the
aggregate of all the papers of that Group/Unit.

(4) A candidate who has passed in any one but not in both the groups/Units of the Final Examination under
the syllabus approved by the Council under clause (iv) of regulation 31 or of the Final Examination as per
the syllabus under paragraph 3 or 3A of Schedule 'B° to the Chartered Accountants Regulations, 1988 or
paragraph 3 of Schedule _BB‘ to the Chartered Accountants Regulations, 1964 (two Groups/Units scheme
after January 1, 1985) enforced at the relevant time shall be eligible for exemption in that particular
Group/Unit and shall be required to appear and pass in the remaining Group/Unit in order to pass the Final
Examination.

(5) The Council may frame guidelines to continue to award exemption in a paper or papers to a candidate,
granted earlier under the syllabus approved under clause (iv) of regulation 31 for the unexpired chance or
chances of the exemption in the corresponding paper or papers in which he had secured exemption, if the
corresponding paper or papers exist in the new syllabus of the Final Examination approved by the Council
under regulation 31(v). On appearing in the examination of the corresponding paper or papers in which he
had failed, he shall be declared to have passed the examination, if he secures at one sitting a minimum of
forty per cent. marks in the corresponding paper or papers in which he had failed earlier and a minimum of
fifty per cent. marks in the aggregate of all the papers of the Group/Unit including the marks of the paper or
papers in which he had earlier been granted exemption by the Council.

(6) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-regulations (1) to (5), a candidate who has appeared in all
the papers comprised in a Group/Unit and fails in one or more papers comprised in a Group/Unit but
secures a minimum of sixty per cent. marks in any paper or papers of that Group/Unit shall be eligible to
appear at any one or more of the immediately next three following examinations in the paper or papers in
which he secured less than sixty per cent. marks. He shall be declared to have passed in that Group/Unit, if
he secures at one sitting a minimum of forty per cent. marks in each of such papers and a minimum of fifty



[\ 1H—ETE 4] T T TSI © T 21

per cent. of the total marks of all papers of that Group/Unit including the paper or papers in which he had
secured a minimum of sixty per cent. marks in the earlier examination referred to above. He shall not be
eligible for any further exemption in the remaining paper or papers of that Group/Unit until he has
exhausted the exemption already granted to him in that Group/Unit]

(7) If a candidate has exhausted the exemption granted to him under sub-regulation (6) and he was not able
to pass the said Group/Unit, he may opt for the continuing of said exemption to the subsequent
examinations. However, in such a case, such candidate shall be required to obtain a minimum of fifty per
cent marks in each of the remaining paper/s of that Group/Unit in order to declare him to have passed in
that Group/Unit.

(8) The Council may adopt the criteria of negative marking in a paper or papers having objective type
questions in such manner as may be specified by it from time to time.”;

217. In regulation 39, in sub-regulation (1), for clause (a), the following clause (a) shall be substituted,
namely,-

“(a) The result of each examination indicating whether a candidate has been successful or unsuccessful in
the said examination shall be made available on the website of the Institute;”;

28. In regulation 40, for sub-regulation (1), the following shall be substituted, namely,-

“(1) A candidate who has passed the Intermediate (Integrated Professional Competence) Examination,
Intermediate Examination or Final Examination held under these regulations shall be granted a certificate to
that effect in the Form approved by the Council.

Provided that the Council may refuse to grant such certificate to a candidate who has passed the final
examination but has not complied with other provisions of these regulations which are required to be
complied with for becoming a member of the Institute.

Provided further that a candidate may apply for Business Accounting Associate Certificate on fulfilment of
the criteria as specified by the Council from time to time.”;

29. In regulation 45, in sub-regulation (1),-
(i In clause (a), after the word and figures “regulation 43,”, the words “having regard to”
shall be inserted:;
(i) In clause (b)(i) of sub-regulation (1), after the words and figure “regulation 28G”, the
words and figure “or both the Groups of Intermediate Examination held under regulation
281" shall be inserted.;

30. In regulation 48, in sub-regulation (1), for the Table, the following Table shall be substituted,
namely,-

“Table
Classification of the Normal place | During the | During the second | During the third
of service of the articled assistant first year of | year of training year of training
training
) ) ®) (4)
(i) Cities/Towns having population of | Rs.4000/- Rs.5000/- Rs.6000/-
twenty lakhs and above
(ii) Cities/Towns having population | Rs.3000/- Rs.4000/- Rs.5000/-
of five lakhs and above but less than
twenty lakhs
(iii)  Cities/Towns  having  a | Rs.2000/- Rs.3000/- Rs.4000/-
population of less than five lakhs

31. In regulation 50,-
(1) In clause (ii), for the words “three years”, the words “two years” shall be substituted;

(i) For the proviso to clause (ii), the following proviso shall be substituted, namely, -




22 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART 1I—SEC.4]

“PROVIDED that a candidate who was registered as an articled assistant for a period of three years before
coming into force the Chartered Accountants (2" Amendments) Regulations, 2022 shall be eligible to
continue and complete the remaining period of practical training as per the deed of articles executed under
these regulations irrespective of any break in the continuity of training.”

32. In regulation 51,-

() In sub-regulation (1), after the words “Intermediate examination” the words “under these
regulations” shall be inserted and for the words “eighteen months”, the words “twelve
months” shall be substituted;

(i) In sub-regulation (4) and (9), for the words “eighteen months”, the words “twelve months”
shall be substituted:;

(iii) In sub-regulation (11), after the words, “industrial training”, the words
minimum of rupees fifteen thousand per month” shall be inserted;

“ subject to a
(iv) After sub-regulation (11), the following sub-regulation (12), shall be inserted, namely,-

“(12) Notwithstanding anything contained in this regulation, an articled assistant who is already undergoing
industrial training on or before the coming into force of the Chartered Accountants (2" Amendments)
Regulations, 2022 shall be eligible to continue and complete the remaining period of industrial training as
per agreement of training entered into under sub-regulation (6).”

33. In regulation 51D, after the words “Intermediate Course”, the word “either” and after the words
and figure, the words and figure “or under regulation 28H, as the case may be” shall be inserted.

34. In regulation 51E, for the words “last two years”, the word “period” and for the words “without any
break in continuity” the words “and before appearing in the Final examination” shall be substituted;

35. After regulation 51E, the following regulation 51F, shall be inserted, namely,-
“51F. Self paced online modules

“(1) A candidate who has passed both the Groups of the Intermediate Examination shall be required to
undergo and pass self paced online modules consisting of such number of modules and in such manner as
may be specified by the Council from time to time.

(2) A candidate shall be declared to have passed in the self paced modules if he obtains a minimum of
fifty per cent marks in each module.”

36. In regulation 54, in sub-regulation (5), for the word “eighteen”, the word “twelve” shall be
substituted:;

37. After regulation 54A, the following regulation 54AA shall be inserted, namely,-

“54AA. Practical Training of a candidate who is residing outside India under eligible members of
Accountancy Institutions or Bodies outside India

A candidate who is residing outside India may undergo the practical training under eligible members of
such other accounting institutions or bodies outside India recognized by the International Federation of
Accountants in such manner as may be determined by the Council.”;

38. In regulation 56, for first proviso to sub-regulation (1), the following proviso shall be substituted,
namely, -

“Provided that in the first year of such training, the articles so engaged may, by agreement between the
articled assistant and his principal, be terminated. During the second year of training, the termination of
articles shall be permitted if the articled assistant opts for industrial training or under such exceptional
circumstances or conditions, as may be decided by the Council.’

39. In regulation 59,-
Q) For sub-regulation (1), the following shall be substituted, namely,-

“(1)  Anarticled assistant shall be eligible for leave of twelve days in each year of his practical training.
(i) Sub-regulations (2), 4) and (5) shall be omitted,;
(iii) In sub-regulation (7),-



[\ 1H—ETE 4] T T TSI © T 23

(d) In Explanation (1), for the words “Course on Information Technology Training, and
Course on General Management and Communication Skills: the words “Course under
regulation 51E” shall be substituted;

(b) Explanation (2) shall be omitted
(iv)  After sub-regulation (7), the following sub-regulation (8), shall be inserted, namely,-

“(8) An articled assistant who is already registered on or before the coming into force of the Chartered
Accountants (2" Amendments) Regulations, 2022 shall continue to be governed by the provisions of this
regulation which were in force prior to their amendment and as per the deed of articles executed under
these regulations.

CA. (Dr.) JAI KUMAR BATRA, Secy.
[ADVT.-111/4/Exty./103/2022-23]

Note : The principal regulations were published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, dated the 1* June,
1988 vide Notification number 1-CA(7)/134/88 dated 1% June, 1988 and last amended vide
Notification No. 1-CA(7)/198/2021 published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary dated 7"
March, 2022

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.




		2022-06-02T22:51:00+0530
	MANOJ KUMAR VERMA




