#mg&# nﬁ

WRTITON TFLIXORTHTH
c;’)?)’ew ooy BB

PR-9 O Boneed, Honwmes, NI, wiRewtt, 5090 (es%oﬁm;, 90, IFIRE, OEYR) 20. a8
Part—-IVA BENGALURU, TUESDAY, 12, OCTOBER, 2021 (ASHWAYUJA , 20, SHAKAVARSHA, 1943) No. 833

PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS AND LEGISLATION SECRETARIAT
NOTIFICATION
NO: DPAL 28 SHASANA 2021, BENGALURU, DATED:12.10.2021

THE KARNATAKA AGRICULTURAL PESTS AND DISEASES (AMENDMENT) Bill, 2021
AWF, 20218 &FRLWO* Joney 113¢ DTOFHOWY Tow;weOT WA, NI
BRTVBIW),, OIS 3HWPFNON YW, 20210 FOFETF 9DD0HTD F0oel;:
40 DOWIWON Toorddd UTonRBIWS). (Poni  IV-A) R)FE3IZWCFod)
est3¢dT 5o NGs.

KARNATAKA ACT NO. 40 OF 2021

(First Published in the Karnataka Gazette Extra-ordinary on the 12t day of
October 2021)

THE KARNATAKA AGRICULTURAL PESTS AND DISEASES (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2021

(Received the assent of the Governor on the 11th day of October, 2021)

An Act to amend the Karnataka Agricultural Pests and Diseases Act, 1968.

Whereas it is expedient to amend the Karnataka Agricultural Pests and Diseases

Act, 1968 (Karnataka Act 01 of 1969) for the purposes hereinafter appearing;

Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the seventy second year
of the Republic of India, as follows:-

1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the Karnataka
Agricultural Pests and Diseases (Amendment) Act, 2021.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

Q)



S

2. Amendment of section 2.- In the Karnataka Agricultural Pests and
Diseases Act, 1968 (Karnataka Act 01 of 1969)(hereinafter referred to as the
principal Act) in section 2,-

(i) for clauses (2) and (3), the following shall be substituted, namely:-

"(2) “Director of Agriculture” means, any officer appointed by the State
Government to be the Head of the Department of Agriculture and includes the Head
of the Department of Horticulture or Sericulture or Animal Husbandry or Fisheries
or Forest and every person who for the time being performs the duties of the Head
of the Department of Agriculture or Horticulture or Sericulture or Animal
Husbandry or Fisheries or Forest as the case may be.”

“(3) “District officer” means, the officer appointed as such by the State
Government to the department concerned and includes every person who for the
time being performs the duties of the district officer of the department concern to
Agriculture, Horticulture, Sericulture, Animal Husbandry or Fisheries or Forest as
the case may be.”

(ii) for clauses (11) and (12) the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“(11) “Plant” includes all agricultural, horticultural, sericulture, forest crops,
trees, bushes or herbs, climbers, creepers, tubers or rhizomes, suckers or bulbs or
corms/corm lets and includes fruits, leaves, trunk, roots, bark or cutting or any
part thereof but does not include the seed.

Provided that, the State Government may, by notification direct that the seed
of any particular plant shall be deemed to be a plant.”

“(12) “Plant Disease” means, any fungal, bacterial, viral, nematode, parasitic,
mycoplasma or other disease or syndrome declared by the notification under
section 3 to be a plant disease.”

3. Amendment of section 4.- (i) In section 4 of the principal Act, in sub-section

(1)7'

(a) for the words, “the Deputy Director of Agriculture” the words “the District Officer

Concerned” shall be substituted;

(b) in clause (ii), for the words "any male person", the words "any person" shall be

substituted; and

(ii) in sub-section (2), after the words "customary mode" the words "or through print

or and electronic or mass media" shall be inserted.



a

4. Amendment of section 5.- in section 5 of the principal Act, in clause (ii), for the

words “every male person”, the words “every person” shall be substituted.

5. Amendment of section 12.- in section 12 of the principal Act, for the

explanation, the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“Explanation.- for purpose of this section “village officer” includes village
accountant, the panchayat development officer, panchayat secretary, agriculture
assistant, horticulture assistant, sericulture inspector, Sericulture demonstrator or any

other Government officer concerned working in that area.”
6. Amendment of section 13.- (1) in section 13 of the principal Act,-

(a) in sub-sections (1), (2) and (3), for the words “fifty rupees” wherever occurs, the

words “five thousand rupees” shall be substituted; and

(b) in sub- section (4), in clause (b), for the words “five hundred rupees” the words

“twenty-five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

7. Amendment of section 14.- in section 14 of the principal Act, for the words
“Deputy Director of Agriculture” the words “District Officer concerned” shall be

substituted.

By Order and in the name of
the Governor of Karnataka,

G.SRIDHAR
Secretary to Government
Department of Parliamentary
Affairs and Legislation



®

ROIDCOD IF;BWFHBTBNPH eH3), FoAIN T3S T30
ODIPWS
Fo8;: oI ToY 28 FoAS 2021, 230N¥eV), DT00%:12.10.2021
The Karnataka Official Language Act, 1963 (Karnataka Act 26 of 1963) G

RYTTOED 5-00 BRODE), To;0OD0T 99T INRWPYAIR the Karnataka Agricultural
Pests and Diseases (Amendment) Act, 2021 (Karnataka Act 40 of 2021) &
200[WO0ITID), RDTI T,B VB80T TR T TosamI ). (9ort IV-A)
RTEIRWICTOT) e33R INT.

2021 O TooF 83T DI Joad;: 40
(2021 B e9BR,L0T° 30NY 123¢ DIVOTTWOR) FOOEET TotssiRI TS IBeR R0WTONE),

RRTON &FEINT)

FoorédT 3y J0WOD 3ANY) eH3), BRNNY (3T RBR) LIDACHD, 2021
(2021 B ©9BR,LW0° 30NF 113 DT0TTIOTI) To%ss woDDOT 2 TN, BBONNG)

TOOEET Ty FOWOH LN 03, BRENANY 9RO, 196830, 3TN B
2RTBEN 2,0T3) LI ODN.

AL, B, TOTS FOTIWTI NTBLSBNPMON TOoEEIT Ty F0WO0H FCEINSH
D3I, BRNANY 9DIOND, 19683), (19698 Tee€dd 9DIOND 01) 3T B8
2RTIY T O3NTeNBIe)TBOOTT;

AR P03 MEIT0HE DR3BS WREBD), TIEET Tos PO
FDOTBODOTI T3 TNO0RTO3I 9N ONeIZeINE), -

1. 0 R, BRI DI, WYTORW:- (1) T’ WPIADRNE, TVIEET Tyod
ROWOR BLENY) 2N, BRINNY (B3T3 TE) LHRODED, 2021 0T TBONIT,I),,.

(2) BT B8 TRPBEK DN WB3T,,.

2. 233¢ R)FOOT W RBR.- Tooe&dT Ty A0WOH BN D3I, Betnne
IRAOND, 19683 (19698 FXEEIT AP 01) (YL, YRENN0TW DR
9PN OT V3 LNFNG) 23¢ TyFTTE),,-

() (2) DI, B)X VOBWNY WBRN &8 2NV0DITTI, 3 303CRAZT,E),,
®OTIT:-

"2) "TyA ATXETT”  DOWT Vo ATETY) TR FYLRBOD a00NsA DN
SR O03R2,, 9RTD 20, 3RCEMDT e9¥ed0 BLER, I 0 BRAONLLHBS
OO AMDT TR ©Ts YUIBOD VDR, N
ROTPRE VAT IN Ty 953200 SURCEIMNIDT e9IG300 TR, I BIDAONRRLTS
£9T3200 QIETINMRDT 95300 93895 QIR0 2NVsR, 00N 339,OTE). FIE NP0,
a3 E0A B3 3)303PW,, 353,00, WPRRID,HT0.



3

() "BBOD PTID" DOWT Ty ATETad AOWORRE, VB oon
DA 9RTOD NI, AOTWLRERAIT Ty, 3CEMDT, B, BHRORPETI
93230 VMRDT D0 Ty [RINPTR ROWORPRATW YU BOD 233 O
IRNTOAD FIFRNP, 339,0TC). D3RI B8R, 353,000,
WPRRP)T."

(i) (11) 203, (12)3¢ DOTBNPT S8 2NI0RITWI, W3R RIT,E,, DOTWT:-

“(11) "RA;" DOW BT DR, Fyed, 3RCEINDTF, B, , 9T L3FNYD, DTN,
W NBNP) 95330 BRPLOD ARSNED, HTVL,NY), WL,NRSD, RB, NS 9500
TOOBINTINY), WD RTING), 9FPDe  FTOWNRB NS (bulbs) 9500
RB ReoRINPI), (cormbets) wPRRPI LB TP T NS, SN, ToOT,
23BN, 3MES 9T TATIOT L9300 LITT O0EYTK 20N, 2w PR FE)T,
33T ), WwPRRP,HD)..

W30, Vo ATOE T, BPRRATIOD DPDT O30T DDER,, AR
2ETT, BR5IOTII IR I T, OT) DTIEEDRWTBITI).

(12) "AAs TRN"  DOW3 338 JyTTLRBWRONEG), IPIRBION NPT
ARBRENTOT)  PREARIOE BRI dDCOFT, 25800008, 3,83,
SeEZRTE, BRSO, e303TRE, A, G300 YI3T CRINNS) 9530 BUeln ©Fe.”

3. 43¢ R)TOPTW W JBR,- (i) NRD IRINTDT 43¢ JTTLIT (1)3€
NTRTTITE). -

(Q) "TyA NWBW-ATRETTR” DO0W BWNY TN "AOWOLTTES, 230D
DTV D0W BWNPI, w33 AIT,R),.

() (i) DOBRE), "O303¢ RTIR" 02 BWNY 2TEIN 03503 3358, DO
BENYI), B3RBRCRAZTT,,

(i) 23¢ VBVI)TTLOTE), "CRRNI BT BN D0 BWNY 3T02000 “e9T 0
BNTD 9P aNI), WISV I RePNRT/® 035N T” 0 VBN,
~AORIT,T,,.

4. 53¢ RTOHTW 3T JBR:- RO RIONINT 53¢ JyFTT (ii)3C
VOB, "&3 O3, D0 BWNPN * 38R W,, 530" 0L BWNFSY,
3B RRIT,T,,.

5. 1283¢ RF0T ST BR.- DR IRIONTNT 12:3¢ TyFTLIT Je3TWBN
TN B8 20T TWR, )33 CBRIT,T), DOWT:-

" QRVB,- B RTCT B LTT,N "TYe0PNTD” D02 WBWey) Njadd SN,
0TS 93D, LINTOD, TOWIANS FoORNEWIE, TyA ATBOONT, 3LCEINODT
ATOONT, BeR, QOFTD), TR, JTIET 9T F0WOFRE, FLIT), TOR
200323313 038t BIT ATOED LIPTOOON, W FNPRPHTN."



R.N.I. No. KARBIL/2001/47147 POSTAL REGN. No. RNP/KA/BGS/2202/2017-19
Licensed to post without prepayment WPP No. 297

&

6. 13:3¢ B30T 3WH_RBR.- (1) TR LIRIONNT 13:3¢ RT3,

(@) (1), 2) DI, (3)3¢ VTR TTLANYS). "80233), BRTIANNFRBNT” DOW
BIMY)  DNIBNYE).  "80T30  A0IT  TRDICWNFRTBNS” D020 BWRNAPS,
T3 ARBRLBRITE,; D3I,

() (43 NVBTJTTRT () DOBWRE). "20TINPRTY BRTIANNFRBINST” O
BONY  WBON  "GB,3,4,030 AeedT  CR@TIONNFEONS”  Q0W  BWNAPI,
@3BV RITE,.

7. 143¢ RF00T SWIBR.- DR LPRIODINT 143 TyTTLT), "Fyd
NBD- AWETTR” D0W BBNY WRBIN "AOWOFIE, 230D 9PNTD” O
BENFI), B3RP RERAITTD,.

The above translation of the Karnataka Agricultural Pests And Diseases
(Amendment) Act, 2021 (Karnataka Act 40 of 2021) Shall be authoritative text
in Kannda language under section 5-A of the Karnataka Official Language Act,
1963 (Karnataka Act 26 of 1963).

PR T WOT® B LE°
TOOEEIT D550 OT)

TR 3T D500 T 3T T FoT
N3, 9338 BIOSE),,

23.9,030°
ATOE BT FoORETIE,
RORDECD 33553500R S 53,
TR GBI QO083.

BBD Torie BBeFER:- FoBUTIRTOMR, BTeFEId DaRBI), IO Beor) dTmevod, Woriwedh
SUNIL GARDE



		2021-10-12T17:33:40+0530
	SUNIL GARDE




