
(1) 

 

 
  

 

 

Ļ¯ೇಷ ªಾಜÍ ಪĦÎ�ೆ 
 

 

PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS AND LEGISLATION SECRETARIAT 

NOTIFICATION 

NO: DPAL 28 SHASANA 2021, BENGALURU, DATED:12.10.2021 

THE KARNATAKA AGRICULTURAL PESTS AND DISEASES (AMENDMENT) Bill, 2021 
ಇದಃౙ  2021ರ ಅಆౣ ೕಬฑ  ൟಂಗಳ 11ඡ ൽකಂಕඈൿ ฃಜ౲ ඩಲರ ಒඪ౭ ಡ 
අฉൟൿ౪ , ๬෥ನ౲  ൟำವัಃಛಜ ಇದඝ౬  2021ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ ๸ಒ౲ : 
40 ಎಂ්ർಜ ಕකბಟಕ ฃಜ౲ ಪತ౳ ದย౵  (ූಗ IV-A) ಪ౳ ಕഔಸ෎ಃಂൿ 
ಆඃ๏ಸมಜං.  

 
KARNATAKA ACT NO. 40 OF 2021 

 

(First Published in the Karnataka Gazette Extra-ordinary on the 12th day of 
October 2021) 

 

THE KARNATAKA AGRICULTURAL PESTS AND DISEASES (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2021 

 (Received the assent of the Governor on the 11th day of October, 2021) 
 

 An Act to amend the Karnataka Agricultural Pests and Diseases Act, 1968. 

 Whereas it is expedient to amend the Karnataka Agricultural Pests and Diseases 

Act, 1968 (Karnataka Act 01 of 1969) for the purposes hereinafter appearing; 

 Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the seventy second year 

of the Republic of India, as follows:- 

 1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the Karnataka 

Agricultural Pests and Diseases (Amendment) Act, 2021. 

 (2) It shall come into force at once. 

 

s̈ÁUÀ  – 4 ಎ 
Part – IV A 

 , 12 , 2021 ( , 20, , ೧೯೪3) 

BENGALURU,  TUESDAY, 12, OCTOBER, 2021 (ASHWAYUJA , 20, SHAKAVARSHA, 1943) 
. 833

No.     833 



2 

2. Amendment of section 2.- In the Karnataka Agricultural Pests and 

Diseases Act, 1968 (Karnataka Act 01 of 1969)(hereinafter referred to as the 

principal Act) in section 2,- 

(i) for clauses (2) and (3), the following shall be substituted, namely:- 

"(2) “Director of Agriculture” means, any officer appointed by the State 

Government to be the Head of the Department of Agriculture and includes the Head 

of the Department of Horticulture or Sericulture or Animal Husbandry or Fisheries 

or Forest and every person who for the time being performs the duties of the Head 

of the Department of Agriculture or Horticulture or Sericulture or Animal 

Husbandry or Fisheries or Forest as the case may be.” 

“(3) “District officer” means, the officer appointed as such by the State 

Government to the department concerned and includes every person who for the 

time being performs the duties of the district officer of the department concern to 

Agriculture, Horticulture, Sericulture, Animal Husbandry or Fisheries or Forest as 

the case may be.”   

(ii) for clauses (11) and (12) the following shall be substituted, namely:- 

“(11) “Plant” includes all agricultural, horticultural, sericulture, forest crops, 

trees, bushes or herbs, climbers, creepers, tubers or rhizomes, suckers or bulbs or 

corms/corm lets and includes fruits, leaves, trunk, roots, bark or cutting or any 

part thereof but does not include the seed.  

Provided that, the State Government may, by notification direct that the seed 

of any particular plant shall be deemed to be a plant.” 

“(12) “Plant Disease” means, any fungal, bacterial, viral, nematode, parasitic, 

mycoplasma or other disease or syndrome declared by the notification under 

section 3 to be a plant disease.” 

3. Amendment of section 4.- (i) In section 4 of the principal Act, in sub-section 

(1),- 

(a) for the words, “the Deputy Director of Agriculture” the words “the District Officer 

Concerned” shall be substituted; 

(b) in clause (ii), for the words "any male person", the words "any person" shall be 

substituted; and 

(ii) in sub-section (2), after the words "customary mode" the words "or through print 

or and electronic or mass media" shall be inserted. 



 3 

4. Amendment of section 5.- in section 5 of the principal Act, in clause (ii), for the 

words “every male person”, the words “every person” shall be substituted. 

5. Amendment of section 12.- in section 12 of the principal Act, for the 

explanation, the following shall be substituted, namely:- 

“Explanation.- for purpose of this section “village officer” includes village 

accountant, the panchayat development officer, panchayat secretary, agriculture 

assistant, horticulture assistant, sericulture inspector, Sericulture demonstrator or any 

other Government officer concerned working in that area.” 

6. Amendment of section 13.- (1) in section 13 of the principal Act,- 

(a) in sub-sections (1), (2) and (3), for the words “fifty rupees” wherever occurs, the 

words “five thousand rupees” shall be substituted; and 

(b) in sub- section (4), in clause (b), for the words “five hundred rupees” the words 

“twenty-five thousand rupees” shall be substituted. 

7. Amendment of section 14.- in section 14 of the principal Act, for the words 

“Deputy Director of Agriculture” the words “District Officer concerned” shall be 

substituted.  

 
By Order and in the name of 
the Governor of Karnataka, 

 
 

G.SRIDHAR 
Secretary to Government 

Department of Parliamentary 
Affairs and Legislation 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



4 

๸ಸൽೕಯ ವ౲ ವ๻ರಗำ ಮൡ౨  ๎ಸನ ರಚච ಸ೉฿ಲಯ 
ಅඌ๰ಚච 

๸ಒ౲ : ๸ವ౲ ๎ಇ 28 ๎ಸನ 2021, ෍ಂಗิฆ, ൽකಂಕ:12.10.2021 
The Karnataka Official Language Act, 1963 (Karnataka Act 26 of 1963) ರ 

ಪ౳ ಕರಣ 5-ಎ ರലಯย౵  ฃಜ౲ ඩಲคಂದ ಅඌಂತತั๭ದ the Karnataka Agricultural 

Pests and Diseases (Amendment) Act, 2021 (Karnataka Act 40 of 2021) ನ 

ූ๝ಂತರವඝ౬  ಅඌಂತ ಕನ౬ ಡ  ಪಠ౲ ๅಂൿ ಕකბಟಕ ฃಜ౲ ಪತ౳ ದย౵  (ූಗ IV-A) 

ಪ౳ ಕഔಸ෎ಃಂൿ ಆඃ๏ಸมಜං.   

 2021 ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ ๸ಒ౲ :  40 
(2021 ರ ಅಆౣ ೕಬฑ  ൟಂಗಳ 12ඡ ൽකಂಕඈൿ ಕකბಟಕ ฃಜ౲ ಪತ౳ ದ เ๕ಷ ๸೉ಃಯย౵  

෮ದฤ ಪ౳ ಕಟ฿ಜං) 
 

ಕකბಟಕ ಂ๞ ๸ීඌ ౾ೕಟಗำ ಮൡ౨  ฌೕಗಗಳ (ൟൿ౪ ಪല) ಅඌඛಯಮ, 2021 

(2021 ರ ಅಆౣ ೕಬฑ ൟಂಗಳ 11ඡ ൽකಂಕඈൿ ฃಜ౲  ඩಲคಂದ ಒඪ౭ ಡಯඝ౬  ಪഷಯมಜං) 
 

ಕකბಟಕ ಂ๞ ๸ීඌ ౾ೕಟಗำ ಮൡ౨  ฌೕಗಗಳ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1968ඝ౬  ൟൿ౪ ಪല 
෥ಡฤ ಒಂൿ ಅඌඛಯಮ. 

ಇย౵  ಇඝ౬  ෨ಂං ಉഴಬฆವ ಉං౪ ೕಶಗัಛಜ ಕකბಟಕ ಂ๞ ๸ීඌ ౾ೕಟಗำ 
ಮൡ౨  ฌೕಗಗಳ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1968ඝ౬  (1969ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ 01) ൟൿ౪ ಪല 
෥ഴโൿ ෷ಕ౨ ฿ಜฆโದคಂದ; 

ಇൿ ූರತ ಗಣฃಜ౲ ದ ಎಪ౭ ൤౨ ರಡඡ ವಷბದย౵  ಕකბಟಕ ฃಜ౲  เඋನ 
෱ಡಲൽಂದ ಈ ෨ಂൽඦ൤ ಅඌඛಯ෦ತ฿ಗย,- 

1. ๸౾౹ ಪ౨  ກಸฆ ಮൡ౨  ඩ౳ ฏಭ:-  (1)  ಈ ಅඌඛಯಮವඝ౬  ಕකბಟಕ ಂ๞ 
๸ීඌ ౾ೕಟಗำ ಮൡ౨  ฌೕಗಗಳ (ൟൿ౪ ಪല) ಅඌඛಯಮ, 2021 ಎಂൿ ಕฉಯತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

(2) ಇൿ ಈ ಁಡศ ೦คಡ ಬರತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

2.  2ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.-  ಕකბಟಕ ಂ๞ ๸ීඌ ౾ೕಟಗำ ಮൡ౨  ฌೕಗಗಳ 
ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1968ರ (1969ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ 01) (ಇย౵  ಇඝ౬ ෨ಂං ෩ಲ 
ಅඌඛಯಮๅಂൿ ಉว౵ ೕ಍ಸมಜං) 2ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ ,-  

(i) (2) ಮൡ౨  (3)ඡ ಘಡಗಳ ಬದมಜ  ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , 
ಎಂದฉ:-  

“(2) “ಂ๞ ඛඃბಶಕ”  ಎಂದฉ ฃಜ౲  ಸ౽ბರโ ಂ๞ ಇมಒಯ ෨ಖ౲ ಸ౩ කಜ 
ඡ෦๭ದ ෴่ಬ౯  ಅඌ౽ค ಮൡ౨  ൧ೕಟಛคಃ ಅಥ฿ ช๣౱  ಅಥ฿ ಪ๑๸ತೕಪච 
ಅಥ฿ ෦ೕඝಛคಃ ಅಥ฿ ಅರಣ౲  ಇมಒಯ ෨ಖ౲ ಸ౩ ರඝ౬  ๻ಟ 
๸ದූბඝ๬ರ฿ಜ ಂ๞ ಅಥ฿ ൧ೕಟಛคಃ ಅಥ฿ ช๣౱  ಅಥ฿ ಪ๑๸ತೕಪච 
ಅಥ฿ ෦ೕඝಛคಃ ಅಥ฿ ಅರಣ౲   ಇมಒಯ ෨ಖ౲ ಸ౩ ฃಜ ತ൞ౙ ಲದย౵  ಕತბವ౲ ಗಳඝ౬  
ඛವბ๼๯ൟ౨ ฆವ ಪ౳ ൟ෽ಬ౯  ವ౲ ౾౨ ಯඝ౬  ಒಳತำ౶ โൿ. 



 5 

(3) “೧ว౵ ಯ ಅඌ౽ค” ಎಂದฉ ฃಜ౲  ಸ౽ბರโ ๸ීಧಪಟౣ  ಇมಒಡ ๻ಡ 
ඡ෦๭ದ ಅඌ౽ค ಮൡ౨  ๸ದූბඝ๬ರ ಂ๞, ൧ೕಟಛคಃ, ช๣౱ , ಪ๑๸ತೕಪච 
ಅಥ฿ ෦ೕඝಛคಃ ಅಥ฿ ಅರಣ౲  ಇโಗัಡ ๸ීඌ๭ದ  ಇมಒಯ ೧ว౵ ಯ 
ಅඌ౽คಯ ಕತბವ౲ ಗಳඝ౬  ತ൞ౙ ಲದย౵  ඛವბ๼๯ൟ౨ ฆವ ಪ౳ ൟ෽ಬ౯  ವ౲ ౾౨ ಯඝ౬  
ಒಳತำ౶ โൿ.” 

(ii) (11) ಮൡ౨  (12)ඡ ಘಡಗัಡ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

“(11) “ಸಸ౲ ” ಎಂಬ ಪದโ ಎม౵  ಂ๞, ൧ೕಟಛคಃ, ช๣౱ , ಅರಣ౲  ෍ึಗำ, ಮರಗำ, 
ಀฆಚฤ ಜಡಗำ ಅಥ฿ ಔಷඌೕಯ ಸಸ౲ ಗำ, ಏฆಬ ౶ั ಗำ, ಬ ౶ั ಗำ, ಡഷ౥ ಗำ ಅಥ฿ 
౽ಂಡ෎ฆಗำ, ෎ฆ෮ಳಃಗำ, ಅಥ฿ ಉದಗഷ౥ ಗำ (bulbs) ಅಥ฿ 
ಡഷ౥ ಡಣ๯ಗಳඝ౬  (cormbets) ಒಳತำ౶ โൿ ๻ಟ ಹ൒౧ ಗำ, ಎวಗำ, ౽ಂಡ, 
෎ฆಗำ, ൧ಗങ ಅಥ฿ ಕ๭౽ಂಡ ಅಥ฿ ಅದರ ෴โඃ ූಗವඝ౬  ಒಳತำ౶ โൿ,  
ಆದฉ ෈ೕಜವඝ౬  ಒಳತำ౶ โൽಲ౵ . 

ಪฏൡ, ฃಜ౲  ಸ౽ბರโ, ಅඌ๰ಚචಯ ෩ಲಕ ෴โඃ ඛൽბಷౣ  ಸಸ౲ ದ 
෈ೕಜವඝ౬  ಸಸ౲ ๅಂൿ ූเಸತಕౙ ൿ౪  ಎಂൿ ඛඃბ๏ಸಬ๾ൿ. 

(12) “ಸಸ౲  ฌೕಗ”  ಎಂದฉ 3ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದലಯย౵  ಅඌ๰ಚචಯ ෩ಲಕ 
ಸಸ౲ ฌೕಗๅಂൿ ಳೕ๞ಸมದ ෴โඃ ๏ยೕಂಧ౳ ದ, ෇౲ ౾ౣ ೕค෴ದ, ็ರ๭౺ ನ, 
චಮജി, ಪฃವอ෈, ෭ಆඩ౵ ๬౱  ಅಥ฿ ಇತฉ ฌೕಗಗำ ಅಥ฿ ฌೕಗ ಲౘಣ.” 

3. 4ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല,- (i) ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 4ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (1)ඡ 
ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵  ,- 

(ಎ) “ಂ๞ ಉಪ-ඛඃბಶಕฆ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದมಜ “๸ීಧಪಟౣ  ೧ว౵ ಯ 
ಅඌ౽ค” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  

(෈) (ii)ඡ ಘಡದย౵  “෴ช ඬฆಷ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದมಜ “෴ช ವ౲ ౾౨ ” ಎಂಬ 
ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , 

(ii) 2ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵  “งുಗತ ಪದ౪ ൟಯ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ತฆ฿ಯ “ಅಥ฿ 
෨ದ౳ ಣ ಅಥ฿ ಮൡ౨  เൿ౲ ක౱ ನ ಅಥ฿ ಸ෩ಹ ෥ಧ౲ ಮದ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  
๳คಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

4.  5ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല:-  ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 5ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (ii)ඡ 
ಘಡದย౵          “ಪ౳ ൟ෽ಬ౯ ನ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗัಡ “ ಪ౳ ൟ෽ಬ౯  ವ౲ ౾౨ ಯ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  
ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

5. 12ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.-  ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 12ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ เವರൕಡ 
ಬದมಜ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ,  ಎಂದฉ:- 

“ เವರൕ,- ಈ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ “ಛ౳ ෥ඌ౽ค” ಎಂಬ ಪದโ ಛ౳ ಮ ว౾ౙ ಗ, 
ඵೈ෵ൟ ಅ෗ไൽ౪  ಅඌ౽ค, ඵೈ෵ൟ ౽ಯბದ๏ბ, ಂ๞ ಸ๻ಯಕ,൧ೕಟಛคಃ 
ಸ๻ಯಕ, ช๣౱  ඛคೕౘಕฆ, ช๣౱  ಪ౳ ದಶბಕ ಅಥ฿ ๸ීಧಪಟౣ  ಃ౹ ೕತ౳ ದย౵  ಃಲಸ 
෥ഴൟ౨ ฆವ ෴ช  ಇತฉ ಸ౽ბค ಅඌ౽คಯඝ౬  ಒಳತಳ౶ โൿ.” 

 



6 

6.  13ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- (1) ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 13ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ ,- 

(ಎ) (1), (2) ಮൡ౨  (3)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣಗಳย౵  “ಐವൡ౨  งඩ෵ಗಳವฉಜನ” ಎಂಬ 
ಪದಗำ ಬฆๅഷಗಳย౵  “ಐൿ ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳವฉಜನ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  
ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; ಮൡ౨  

(෈) (4)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (෈) ಘಡದย౵  “ಐൿඞฆ งඩ෵ಗಳವฉಜನ” ಎಂಬ 

ಪದಗಳ ಬದมಜ “ಇಪ౭ ൤౨ ೖൿ ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳವฉಜನ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  

ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

7. 14ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 14ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵  “ಂ๞ 
ಉಪ- ඛඃბಶಕฆ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದมಜ “๸ීಧಪಟౣ  ೧ว౵ ಯ ಅඌ౽ค” ಎಂಬ 
ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

The above translation of the Karnataka Agricultural Pests And Diseases 

(Amendment) Act, 2021 (Karnataka Act 40 of 2021) Shall be authoritative text 

in Kannda language under section 5-A of the Karnataka Official Language Act, 

1963 (Karnataka Act 26 of 1963).  

 

൭ವฑ೔ඊ ಡຄ౵ ೕഡ 
ಕකბಟಕ ฃಜ౲ ඩಲฆ 

 
ಕකბಟಕ ฃಜ౲ ඩಲರ ಆඃ๎ඝ๬ರ 

ಮൡ౨  ಅವರ ກಸคನย౵ , 
 

 
೧.๏౳ ೕಧฑ 

ಸ౽ბರದ ౽ಯბದ๏ბ, 
๸ಸൽೕಯ ವ౲ ವ๻ರಗำ ಮൡ౨  

๎ಸನ ರಚච ಇมಒ. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

 

ಮುದÎಕರು ²ಾಗೂ ಪÎ�ಾಶಕರು:- ಸಂಕಲ£ಾĩ�ಾĸಗಳ�, ಕ£ಾ�ಟಕ ªಾಜÍಪತÎ, ಸ�ಾ�ĸ �ೇಂದÎ ಮುದÎ�ಾಲಯ, ¦ೆಂಗಳ�ರು 

R.N.I.  No. KARBIL/2001/47147  POSTAL REGN. No. RNP/KA/BGS/2202/2017-19 

Licensed to post without prepayment   WPP No. 297 


		2021-10-12T17:33:40+0530
	SUNIL GARDE




