#mg&# nﬁ

WRTITON TFLIXORTHTH
c;’)?)’ew ooy BB

PATY LI 2oneet, MTWTT, 02, WA/, 2090 (BJEIN®, 0%, JFITF, 0 ¥a)
Part—IVA BENGALURU, THURSDAY, 07, OCTOBER, 2021 (ASHWAYUJA , 15, SHAKAVARSHA, 1943)

To. L9
No. 824

PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS AND LEGISLATION SECRETARIAT
NOTIFICATION

NO. DPAL 20 SHASANA 2021, BENGALURU, DATED: 07.10.2021

The Karnataka Co-operative Societies (Amendment) Bill, 20219333, 20213

OTRLNIFONEY 530 DIOTLOTW) Vo@DV wad,i BRTIT), Ao0Ss
3PHTLTNMNN YW, 20218 ToeEdT 9RO A0 36 D0WITPN T 3T

D025 BIT3 IR R0WTOR (250N-1V) BE) F3é3ReITOR) e3T3¢dR 0N,

KARNATAKA ACT NO 360F 2021

(First published in the Karnataka Gazette Extra-ordinary on the 7thday of October, 2021)

THE KARNATAKA CO-OPERATIVE SOCIETIES (AMENDMENT)ACT, 2021

(Received the assent of the Governor on the Sthday of October, 2021)

An Act further to amend the Karnataka Co-operative Societies Act, 1959.

Whereas, it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Co-operative

Societies Act, 1959 (Karnataka Act No.11 of 1959) for the purpose hereinafter

appearing.

Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the seventy second year

of the Republic of India as follows:-

1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the Karnataka

Co-operative Societies (Amendment) Act, 2021.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

Q)



S

2. Amendment of section 2.- In the Karnataka Co-operative Societies
Act, 1959 (Karnataka Act No.11 of 1959) hereinafter referred to as the principal

Act), in section 2, for clause (e-1-a) the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“(e-1-a) “Delegate” means a Director of a Co-operative Society appointed by
the Board to represent that Co-operative society in other Co-operative Society with
power to participate and vote in the general meeting and to contest or propose or
second in the election of the Co-operative society to which he is appointed as
delegate.”

3. Amendment of section 6.- In section 6 of the principal Act, in sub-section
(2),-

(i) for clause (b) the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“(b) Where all the applicants are individuals, the number of applicants shall

not be less than twenty and the applicants shall not belong to the same family; and
(ii) after clause (b) the following shall be inserted, namely:-

“(b-1) where all the applicants are cooperative societies, the number of
applicants shall not be less than thirteen.

Provided that State Government may in special cases permit the applicants
co-operative societies less than thirteen.”

4. Amendment of section 17.- In section 17 of the principal Act,-

(i) in sub-section(l), for clause (f) the following shall be substituted,

namely:-

“(f) is a paid employee of the society or its financing bank or its union or its
federal society.”

(ii) for sub-section (2-A), the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“(2-A) If any person is found to be a member or continuing as member in two
or more co-operative societies carrying similar business, it shall be obligatory on
his part to retain membership in any one society of his choice within a period of
ninety days from the date of commencement of the Karnataka Co-operative
Societies (Amendment) Act, 2021. If he fails to do so, his membership shall be
deemed to have been ceased in the Co-operative society to which he is newly

admitted.”



a

5. Amendment of section 20.- In section 20 of the principal Act in sub-section (2),-
(i) in clause (a-iii) for the proviso the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“Provided that nothing in this clause shall apply to member of a society
participating in the first General Body Meeting and the first election of the Board
of such society held immediately after its registration.”

(ii) for clause (a-iv) the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“(a-iv) a member, a representative or a delegate who has failed to attend at
least any two annual general meeting out of the last five annual general

meetings duly communicated to him;”

(iii) for clause (a-v) except the proviso, the following shall be substituted,

namely:-

“(a-v) a member or a representative who has failed to utilize such minimum
services or facilities as may be specified in the Bye-Laws for any two Co-

operative years out of the last five Co-operative years;”

(iv) in proviso to clause (a-v) for the words “three years” the words “one year” shall

be substituted; and

(v) in clause (b) in explanation for the words “fifteen days” and “thirty days” the

words “twenty one days” and “forty five days” shall respectively be substituted.

6. Insertion of new section 22.- After section 21 of the principal Act, the
following shall be inserted, namely:-

“22. Restrictions on holding shares.-In any cooperative society, no member
other than the Government, or any other cooperative society with the previous sanction of
the state Government, the State Warehousing Corporation or Zilla Panchayath constituted
under the Karnataka Gram Swaraj and Panchayat Raj Act, 1993 (Karnataka Act No 14 of
1993) or any statutory or non-statutory board, committee or corporation shall hold more
than such portion of the total share capital of the society not exceeding five percent thereof

as may be prescribed.”

7. Amendment of section 27A.-In section 27A of theprincipal Act,-

(i) in clause (a) for the word “three” the word “two” shall be substituted;
(ii) in clause (b) after the words “specified in the byelaws” the words “for any

two



®

co-operative years out of the last five co-operative years” shall be inserted;
and

(iii) in the proviso for the words “three years” the words “one year” shall be
substituted.

8. Amendment of section 28.-In section 28 of the principal Act, after sub-

section (2) the following shall be inserted, namely:-

“(3) The quorum for the special general meeting shall be the same as specified

in sub-section (4) of section 27.”

9. Amendment of section 29C.- In section 29C of the principal Act,-

(i) in sub-section (1), in clause (a) after the words “co operative society” the

words “or Souhardha co-operative” shall be inserted;

(ii) in sub-section (8), in clause (d) for the words “in cases falling under clauses
(@), (b), (c) and (d) of this sub-section” the words “in cases falling under
clauses (a), (b), (c) and (d) of this sub-section remove and” shall be

substituted.

10. Amendment of section 29E,- In section 29E of the principal Act, after the
first proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:-

“provided further that the board may fill up casual vacancy of the board by
nomination out of the same class of members in respect of which the casual vacancy has

arisen till the election is held for such vacancy.”

11. Amendment of section 39AA.- In section 39AA of the Principal Act, in sub-
section (2), for the words “electoral rolls for” the words “electoral rolls and conduct of” shall

be substituted.

12. Amendment of section 39I.- In section 391 of the principal Act,

(i) in sub-section (4) after the words “this section applies are” the words

“the election officers” shall be inserted; and

(ii) after the words “in connection with the” the words “preparation of

electoral roll or” shall be inserted.



3

13. Amendment of section 68.- In section 68 of the principal Act, in sub-section
(1);-
(i)for the words “The Registrar may” the words “The Registrar shall” shall be

substituted; and

(ii) after the word “disclosed” the words “in the audit report under section 63 or” shall

be inserted.

14. Amendment of section 72.- In section 72 of the principal Act, after sub-section
(5) the following shall be inserted, namely;-

“(6) The process of winding up of a co-operative society under sub-sections (1), (2)
and (5) above, shall be completed within a period of three years from the date of direction
from the Registrar:

Provided that the said period may be extended by the Registrar for the reasons to
be recorded in writing for a further period of one year:

Provided further that the State Government may, on a report made by the Registrar
shall have power to extend the said period, if it is satisfied that, there are genuine grounds

for the extension.”

15. Substitution of expression Co-operation Election Authority.- In the
principal Act, for the words “Cooperative Election Commission” wherever they

occur, the words “Cooperative Election Authority” shall be substituted.

By Order and in the name of
the Governor of Karnataka,

(G. SRIDHAR)
Secretary to Government
Department of Parliamentary Affairs
and Legislation



&

FOIDCOD W PHTONY) =NI3). ToIS WS TN
ODTNPWBI
30835: FOW;T0Y 20 FoI 2021, 230N LT, DO0F: 07.10.2021.

The Karnataka Official Language Act, 1963 (Karnataka Act 26 of 1963) G
TYTTED 5-0d BRONE), To5HOODOT 9T 3NRPAT the Karnataka Co-operative
Societies (Amendment) Act, 2021 (Karnataka Act 36 of 2021) T 200e&003Ta300,
IPTHYI TR BO5R0R) TOREE)T ToBsBIT TR R0WBTAD (on-IV) 3,
RTEIRWICTOT) e33R INT.

20218FTF 83D 0D DT 0;: 36
(20213 £980,£20° BONF T3 DVVOTTIOTW) Fooe 3T Dats;BIT DR B0 TONE), BBRTWEN 3yTEING)

FooFédT IBT0 FOoFNY (3T IR) 9D ODHD, 2021
(202138 €98R,£LW0T° 30NF 53¢ DITVOTEOT) TdZ5a00ODOTS €9:30e30 30D, SBBODINGI)

TIOEET ABTT ROPNY 9PRIOND, 195930, D3R, ISTWOHE 0B 20T
(STAINIOVWA WY

[, YR, WOTW FOWY W3 NBVLINPMN, TooeedT ABTOT AOPNY LRI,
195930, (1959 O TRoe&dT ©RPRAADED ROV 11) D3R, 3T BB 330BIHT
ONITINTVYH OO,

YR, LT3 N9TT DR,3TBIE WRETWE), FOOEEIT Tosy PO sDOWODOT &3
EO0RNT03 IR eI ):-

1. F0F R, BID) DI, TYT0W.- T8 BRIODTNE, TOIEELT ABTOT ROPNY
(3T EWB) 9RO, 2021 OT FTODNIT,TD,.

(2)BT), B8 TRTWEK 230N 203T3T,T0,..

2. 283¢ RBOOTW W BR.-Toor&dT ABTOT ROPNY RIORD, 19593 (19593
FOOEET RO F0B5:11) (VW3 BN, 30T eNR IR0 OT Se3 DR DNT)
23¢ BTTRTE). (9-1-0) DOTT, WBEIVN B8 sNI0DITR, &) 33eCRRIT,T),, DOTT:-

"(8-1-) "TAIY" NOW3, T APODE), 2I0NT0AE NI, NIRRT
9PTOTRRODT IV ABTT FOPNY), €3 ABTOT AOTeIY,y, TSR NI, €33 TSI
NOT T, SeNTONTIRIPRL €3 IBTOT AOPR VR HBONE). BDERE €90
9303 RERFE) e9TTeI0 2302 RN eNOBP ANOT FeeNTeIILS ABTOT RO DTLETB."

3.683¢R) TV STWIBR.- 300 LIRIODNTNT 63¢ TWF TS (2)3 VT -TyFTETIC), -
(i) (23) DOBT TN 85 TVODTTRN, T8 ARCBRIT, T, DOTIT:-

")) DY, IVFWITT) WA NPINTVEE), IREWITT AOB;00) 9R,33,03 TR
BOIT,EL), &I, L9ETWTT) 20T ENOWT, ADTIT, T, a03D,”

(i) (23) DOBT 3T B8 20T, ADAIT,EN,, DOTWT:-

"(2)-1) DEIY, L9EFTIOTTY ABBOT AOPNYINTL),, €923 3T 0835030 BRTNRTE,03
TR YOITHEL,:



b

VB0I) Tz ATIFTE) )BR TJyTTINTYS) 900 ABTOT AOPNY F0a350300
BRNRTB,03 TR B I, €93 3R DTIT.”

4.173¢ RF)FTHTW STWI_BR.- DR LPIONNT 17:3¢ WyTTTE), -

(i) (1) FFTTEOT "D DOTT TN 85 TNIODTTRN, &SRR RIT, T, DOTIT:-

"(RQFPF) ROPT T30 LITT, BEITOAD WwHBNAES W0 IR0 CIWT WwT,E €953

933 AOONT, FOFDOT FOWF BT30S YVWRLNOIDNGT 3."

(i) () MVBTYFTTLT BT T3 VORI T, &By33RCBRIT,),, DOTT:-

"(2-0d) O300TE 35030 200TE WO 235833000 SWRISBIe3 DTTW ITTede 323, ABTO0
ROPRYS), ATR;L0NTVHT) T ABAsOON  3V0TITTONZTFHTY  FOWIWOTE),,
TOOEET AD®TOT AORPNY (ST RB) 9DAODD, 2021 B @80T DI0TDOT 3R0WI),
DINY 9RO WwPMN 33T 303,03 V)T 2w0TY FOPRE), AWRsI, PP ITRR,)T
33N WOl35NTITLE),. TN EBEN €33 IPONVIRT, €33 BRAWIN O30 ABTT
ROFT, ALDTIEIeE 9T ATWA3,2d) V03D BLRETHTOLD 30IAIT,T3),,."

5. 20:3¢ BTV 3WI_RVV.- 20RO IR0 203 T TS (2)E NVBTyFTEITIC), -

(i) (eRiii) DOBT BTOINTFTE TN, T3 TNI0DTTWR, T3A3eCBRIT,,,

NOTT:-

"BB0I) B3 DOBEE).BIeHT3) O330e3)T3/0 93T BRLOTIEIOIIVE DFES 3TII00 ST
903 ROPTW RWRWD eNTORLONED), eI, RORPT B3 TNOBPO BRTWS 2RVIBONE),
290N 20RIE BWRIN 953,00 3T,TE),."

(ii) (d-iv) DOBT TR B8 TVODITI,, T8 A3RERRIT, T, DOTT:-

"(-iv) €331 O300T.200N PRV FFTS 0T WOAE T s30T ALPNY &y TR, O0eH T

DT AT aNTO AN TOTINEN IRPOVIE W, ABAs W, TYSVY 9T 22,
Qa3eN."
(i) BB0T, BRTIVTBRA (d-V) DOBT AN, B3 TIODITIR,
3B RRIT,T,, DOTT:-

"(@-V) 00D 8%) ABTOT SRENG Tyd ODYTE NCBY ABIOT  SRETO,N
NBIRNY ), APER FDRAWTITOTOT TR, ACINP R, €I APOBNY Y, WFRABTRLL)
LIFOVIE W, AWRs €TI0 202, TJSR.”

(iv) (D-V) DOBET 9BODE)S BTVOINTHE). "2DRTY BRENY” D0W BBNLT “200T
VRET" D0 BBNP, T3S RERRITTD,.

V) () DOBBAS dWTBONE), "BRIZEY DINLT" aDIB), 20D, DINPR” 0
BENY BN "B B3RO DINPR” NI, "SOWZ 4T DINLR” D02 JITRSI,
I TeDoN &Ty3A3RERAIT,T),;

6. 2230 BPX IFTOOT FRVFW.- DR LIRDIONNT 2136 TyTTLE 3T2e3003, B3
EORTTI, AORIT,E,, DOTWT:-

“22. ReNY, BRODTIFHWT 3 dWFoPReH:- CRz)TE ABTOD FOPT),,
RTOETHOL O30T ATBASD 900 T ATOE BT FRIE a0 RT0S WHLI O0)T B3T
RDBTOT RO, Vs YUY ANed) LIF0 TOREET M X002 aNI), WOFIONIT® T
9PN, 19933 (19938 TerddT IRV R0Bs 14) ROD), TWBIE 2,
FWOFONS 93200 O30e) T TORTTI, €TI0 TOASWILIDLE eN0TWY, HeddS L9T3ad0 INeded)



9)

QORNNBWTITOEBO3  FORT 283, REB) WORBRYRL), FHIW OWTR, CTWOT
290N ,038 323, RTI), BROTWITHEL,:"

7. 27 RFF00TE SWI_RBR.- 30RO PTG 27:3¢ ByFTTRC),, -
(i) () DOBTE), "eRNRTY" D02 WRTI WIAN "DTTBY" D02 TWTIaIy

3B RIT,,,;
(i) () VOBRA), "NTIPRTS)." D0 BRW RPBOR  "TFE 00 ABTOO
BRENYD), 030eYTX DT ABTOD R NN D0 BRNAPI,  ALDRITLI,,;
I,
(iii) BTOINFTRE), "eNRTI WRENFY" 02 BWNY LTBAN "200T3) TBRE T 2dOW
TEATR, T35 RIE,T.,.

8. 28:3¢ ITTOTW W JBR.- 3DRS LIRIANTNT 283 FFTTHT (2)I€ NT TyFTEITI
33025003 B8 0T TIN, ADRIT,,, DOTT:-

"3) AFHR DTOAEMON  FRCTO, 273 JyTTLHW  (4) I B-IFTILTE).
APEBBRATO3ARE YT3IT,E,.."

9. 29 & RFOHW 3T BR.- DR LRI 292 FFTLTC) -

(i) (13 NVBIFFTTRT () DOBRE), "ABBTOT IOPT,” 02 BWNY 3TI000 "eITIz00

APTOTE ABTOON" D0 WERNFPD, AOAITT,;

(i) (8)3¢ NVTTJyTTLIT (B) VOWRE)., "LITBERRPIWITIR" D02 RBWEW WHBONR
"3RENTOTLTIR) 2NIY, LITT/E RRPAWIDIT" d0W WHReI), &SRB RERAIT,T),..

10. 299 RFOHTW SWIJVR,- DR EIRIONTNT 298 TyFTLWE), DR BTO0INTT
3300003, B8 &0 BB0INTeSI), ALDRIT,),, DOWT:-

"I, WSO BOBWPOD €903 OT, A, NT,N WRV0EIW STONISeITN, YU, e3e00mdes
3039,DT AT, AOWORNAWO3, 9T SINET ABRVIMNY Byd D0aNITESIT aDROT
FOBYAD F0I9,DT AR, Sedd, A 0TIVT/IT.”

11. 39 R RFFOHTW ST RVBB.- RO BRI 39 N IJFTTEIT, ()3 G-
TTVRTA), "eNIWT BES,NPRN," D0 BWNY WBONR  "eNIWTT BEJ,NP," DOW
BEAPI, T 3BRCBRIT,R,.

12. 398 RyFOHW STWIBJBB.- 3DR LIRICNNT 3980 TyFTLTE). -
(i) (43¢ NT-TTTLOT), "&8 WFTTag) 93,000 2353, NFOTT” 0 BTNY
330000 "DV RTINS D02 BWNP ), ACDRITLE),; a3,
(ii) "FPCIOTE e3ALRT® MY DIY," DO BWNY 3TV “eNIWOTT T3 000,
AT BRRITYTTO,N 9T " 0 BWNFI), AADRIT,R),.

13. 68:3¢RTOLTWIADI RBR.-zNRO  IRPACNNT 683 FyFTLXRA), (N3¢ v
BBTEE) -

(i) "ATIEDRTIC" 2020 BT TN * ATLEDRIT,TI," D02 I3,

TR RRIT,),,; a0,



R.N.I. No. KARBIL/2001/47147 POSTAL REGN. No. RNP/KA/BGS/2202/2017-19
Licensed to post without prepayment WPP No. 297

¢

(ii) "BTOPTIONF T, "0 BT 3B2z3003 "633¢ &YTTHTS L9BORNDS 3T,
TOBRLET0 BCDONE). e9ITFaI0" D02 BWRF Y, ALDRITE,.

14. 72:3¢ RF0OTW SWI_BR.-330R LIPNIONTNT 72:3¢ TyTTLIT (5)¢ ND FFTDT
33025003, B8 BV0DITRN, ADRIT,T, DOTT:-

"6) WNC,B (1), (2) DI, (5) I VIV FFTTNY IRONCE). ABTOT AOTT
AT INR DRI 313000 DA, 0° 95330 ATRE TS AT DVOTROT DRV SRENY
93ABPFT STYONRRY,3T,T),.:

RB03) DDITE). TeNDRITIT FoTLANPMON DRF, B30, WD 9HONTY, 20T
BVRET 2N3R0T) LITRN LI DRWIBIT:
DI, VC0I) Toxg ATOETY), DRAY,,CD 08T R[TDOD N3, JATBMON 32

FOVNPTBONOT)  DINOWS, WoNDRITIE  FTOTLNPMON  9TBRONT),  DRDAIS
ORDTOTI, BRORDTIT,R,,."

15. IBTOO WHINOW O FO,PTOVT VLR Y OD &) 303 C%RN.- 2R IRDIONTNTE),
"NOTOT WDV e3A3REN" D0W WRNPY 0T TBNFS3 e, "ABTOT RV )T T”
N0 BRNP,, T3S RRIT),.

The above translation of the Karnataka Co-operative Societies (Amendment)
Act, 2021 (Karnataka Act 36 of 2021) shall be authoritative text in the Kannada
language under section S5A of the Karnataka Official Language Act, 1963
(Karnataka Act 26 of 1963).

GPOR0* WOR* B L3
FoOF &% U9 2;m0000)

FTOOEEIT To253000T TR TOV AT
N3, 9338 BIDIC).,

(2. e3o?)
RTOETT FoORNEIDE,
RORDEOD s3553500MS eH3y,
JAS BB 93

BBBD Torie BFeFER:- FoBUTRTOMR, BTFEIB DaRBI), JFBoFD Beor) dTmevod, oriedh

SUNIL GARDE 32yt



		2021-10-07T18:23:20+0530
	SUNIL GARDE




