
(1) 

 

 
  

 

 

Ļ¯ೇಷ ªಾಜÍ ಪĦÎ�ೆ 
 

 

PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS AND LEGISLATION SECRETARIAT 
NOTIFICATION 

NO. DPAL 20 SHASANA 2021, BENGALURU, DATED: 07.10.2021 

 
 

 

The Karnataka Co-operative Societies (Amendment) Bill, 2021ಇದಃౙ  2021ರ 

ಅಆౣ ೕಬൟბಂಗಳ 5ඡ ൽකಂಕඈൿ ฃಜ౲ ඩಲರ ಒඪ౭ ಡ අฉൟൿ౪ , ๬෥ನ౲  

ൟำವัಃಛಜ ಇದඝ౬  2021ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ ๸ಒ౲ : 36 ಎಂ්ർಜ ಕකბಟಕ 

ฃಜ౲ ಪತ౳ ದ เ๕ಷ ๸೉ಃಯ (ූಗ-IV) ರย౵  ಪ౳ ಕഔಸ෎ಃಂൿ ಆඃ๏ಸมಜං. 
 

KARNATAKA ACT NO 36OF 2021 
(First published in the Karnataka Gazette Extra-ordinary on the 7thday of October, 2021) 

 

THE KARNATAKA CO-OPERATIVE SOCIETIES (AMENDMENT)ACT, 2021 

(Received the assent of the Governor on the 5thday of October, 2021) 
 

 
 

An Act further to amend the Karnataka Co-operative Societies Act, 1959. 

 Whereas, it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Co-operative 

Societies Act, 1959 (Karnataka Act No.11 of 1959) for the purpose hereinafter 

appearing. 

 Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the seventy second year 

of the Republic of India as follows:- 

1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the Karnataka 

Co-operative Societies (Amendment) Act, 2021. 

 

   (2) It shall come into force at once. 

 
 

s̈ÁUÀ  – 4 ಎ 
Part – IV A 

 , 07 , 2021 ( , 15, , ೧೯೪3) 

BENGALURU, THURSDAY, 07,  OCTOBER, 2021 (ASHWAYUJA , 15, SHAKAVARSHA, 1943) 
. 824

No.     824 



2 

2. Amendment of section 2.- In the Karnataka Co-operative Societies 

Act, 1959 (Karnataka Act No.11 of 1959) hereinafter referred to as the principal 

Act), in section 2, for clause  (e-1-a) the following shall be substituted, namely:- 

  “(e-1-a) “Delegate” means a Director of a Co-operative Society appointed by 

the Board to represent that Co-operative society in other Co-operative Society with 

power to participate and vote in the general meeting and to contest or propose or 

second in the election of the Co-operative society to which he is appointed as 

delegate.”   

        3. Amendment of section 6.- In section 6 of the principal Act, in sub-section 

(2),- 

        (i) for clause (b) the following shall be substituted, namely:- 

“(b) Where all the applicants are individuals, the number of applicants shall 

not be less than twenty and the applicants shall not belong to the same family; and  

(ii) after clause (b) the following shall be inserted, namely:- 

“(b-1) where all the applicants are cooperative societies, the number of 

applicants shall not be less than thirteen.  

Provided that State Government may in special cases permit the applicants 

co-operative societies less than thirteen.” 

4. Amendment of section 17.- In section 17 of the principal Act,- 

(i) in sub-section(1), for clause (f) the following shall be substituted, 

namely:- 

        “(f) is a paid employee of the society or its financing bank or its union or its 

federal society.” 

(ii) for sub-section (2-A), the following shall be substituted, namely:- 

“(2-A) If any person is found to be a member or continuing as member in two 

or more co-operative societies carrying similar business, it shall be obligatory on 

his part to retain membership in any one society of his choice within a period of 

ninety  days from the date of commencement of the Karnataka Co-operative 

Societies (Amendment) Act, 2021. If he fails to do so, his membership shall be 

deemed to have been ceased in the Co-operative society to which he is newly 

admitted.” 



 3 

     5. Amendment of section 20.- In section 20 of the principal Act in sub-section (2),- 

(i) in clause (a-iii) for the proviso the following shall be substituted, namely:- 

“Provided that nothing in this clause shall apply to member of a society 

participating in the first General Body Meeting and the first election of the Board 

of such society held immediately after its registration.” 

(ii) for clause (a-iv) the following shall be substituted, namely:- 

“(a-iv) a member, a representative or a delegate who has failed to attend at 

least any two annual general meeting out of the last five annual general 

meetings duly communicated to him;” 

(iii) for clause (a-v) except the proviso, the following shall be substituted, 

namely:- 

“(a-v) a member or a representative who has failed to utilize such minimum 

services or facilities as may be specified in the Bye-Laws for any two Co-

operative years out of the last five Co-operative years;” 

(iv) in proviso to clause (a-v)  for the words “three years” the words “one year” shall 

be substituted; and 

(v) in clause (b) in explanation for the words “fifteen days” and “thirty days” the 

words  “twenty one days” and “forty five days” shall respectively be substituted.  

 6. Insertion of new section 22.- After section 21 of the principal Act, the 

following shall be inserted, namely:- 

“22. Restrictions on holding shares.-In any cooperative society, no member 

other than the Government, or any other cooperative society with the previous sanction of 

the state Government, the State Warehousing Corporation or Zilla Panchayath constituted 

under the Karnataka Gram Swaraj and Panchayat Raj Act, 1993 (Karnataka Act No 14 of 

1993) or any statutory or non-statutory board, committee or corporation shall hold more 

than such portion of the total share capital of the society not exceeding five percent thereof 

as may be prescribed.” 

 

7. Amendment of section 27A.-In section 27A of theprincipal Act,-  

(i) in clause (a) for the word “three” the word “two”  shall be substituted; 

(ii) in clause (b) after the words  “specified in the byelaws” the words “for any 

two  



4 

co-operative years out of the last five co-operative years”  shall be inserted; 

and  

(iii) in the proviso for the words “three years” the words  “one year”  shall be 

substituted.  

 8. Amendment of section 28.-In section 28 of the   principal Act, after  sub-

section (2) the following shall be inserted, namely:- 

          “(3) The quorum for the special general meeting shall be the same as specified 

in sub-section (4) of section 27.”   

 

9. Amendment of section 29C.- In section 29C of the principal Act,- 

(i) in sub-section (1), in clause (a) after the words “co operative society” the 

words “or Souhardha co-operative” shall be inserted;  

(ii) in sub-section (8), in clause (d) for the words “in cases falling under clauses 

(a), (b), (c) and (d) of this sub-section” the words “in cases falling under 

clauses (a), (b), (c) and (d) of this sub-section remove and”  shall be 

substituted. 

 

10. Amendment of section 29E,- In section 29E of the principal Act, after the 

first proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:- 

“provided further that the board may fill up casual vacancy of the board by 

nomination out of the same class of members in respect of which the casual vacancy has 

arisen till the election  is held for such vacancy.” 

 

11. Amendment of section 39AA.- In section 39AA of  the Principal Act, in sub-

section (2), for the words “electoral rolls for” the words “electoral rolls and conduct of” shall 

be substituted.  

 

12. Amendment of section 39I.- In section 39I of the principal Act,  

(i) in sub-section (4) after the words “this section applies are” the words 

“the election officers” shall be inserted; and  

(ii) after the words “in connection with the” the words “preparation of 

electoral roll or” shall be inserted. 

 



 5 

          13. Amendment of section 68.- In section 68 of the principal Act, in sub-section 

(1);- 

      (i)for the words “The Registrar may” the words “The Registrar shall” shall be 

substituted; and  

      (ii) after the word “disclosed” the words “in the audit report under section 63 or” shall 

be inserted. 

14. Amendment of section 72.- In section 72 of the principal Act, after sub-section 

(5)  the following shall be inserted, namely;- 

“(6) The process of winding up of a co-operative society under sub-sections (1), (2) 

and (5) above, shall be completed within a period of three years from the date of direction 

from the Registrar: 

Provided that the said period may be extended by the Registrar for the reasons to 

be recorded in writing for a further period of one year: 

Provided further that the State Government may, on a report made by the Registrar 

shall have power to extend the said period, if it is satisfied that, there are genuine grounds 

for the extension.” 

 

 15. Substitution of expression Co-operation Election Authority.- In the 

principal Act, for the words  “Cooperative Election Commission” wherever they 

occur, the words “Cooperative Election Authority” shall be substituted. 

 

By Order and in the name of 

the Governor of Karnataka, 
 

(G. SRIDHAR) 
Secretary to Government 

Department of Parliamentary Affairs 
and Legislation 

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



6 

๸ಸൽೕಯ ವ౲ ವ๻ರಗำ ಮൡ౨  ๎ಸನ ರಚච ಸ೉฿ಲಯ 
ಅඌ๰ಚච 

๸ಒ౲ : ๸ವ౲ ๎ಇ 20 ๎ಸನ 2021, ෍ಂಗิฆ, ൽකಂಕ: 07.10.2021. 
 

The Karnataka Official Language Act, 1963 (Karnataka Act 26 of 1963) ರ 

ಪ౳ ಕರಣ 5-ಎ ರലಯย౵  ฃಜ౲ ඩಲคಂದ ಅඌಂತತั๭ದ the Karnataka Co-operative 

Societies (Amendment) Act, 2021(Karnataka Act 36 of 2021) ರ ූ๝ಂತರವඝ౬  

ಅඌಂತ ಕನ౬ ಡ ಪಠ౲ ๅಂൿ ಕකბಟಕ ฃಜ౲ ಪತ౳ ದ เ๕ಷ ๸೉ಃಯ (ූಗ-IV) ರย౵  

ಪ౳ ಕഔಸ෎ಃಂൿ ಆඃ๏ಸมಜං. 
 

2021ರಕකბಟಕಅඌඛಯಮ๸ಒ౲ : 36 
 

(2021ರ ಅಆౣ ೕಬฑ ൟಂಗಳ7ඡ ൽකಂಕඈൿ ಕකბಟಕ ฃಜ౲ ಪತ౳ ದ เ๕ಷ ๸೉ಃಯย౵  ෮ದฤ ಪ౳ ಕಟ฿ಜං) 
 

ಕකბಟಕ ಸಹ౽ರ ๸ಘಗಳ (ൟൿ౪ ಪല) ಅඌඛಯಮ, 2021 
 

(2021ರ ಅಆౣ ೕಬฑ ൟಂಗಳ 5ඡ ൽකಂಕඈൿ ฃಜ౲ ඩಲคಂದ ಅඝಮൟಯඝ౬  ಪഷಯมಜං) 
 

ಕකბಟಕ ಸಹ౽ರ ๸ಘಗಳ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1959ඝ౬  ಮತ౨ ๠ౣ  ൟൿ౪ ಪല ෥ಡฤ ಒಂൿ 
ಅඌඛಯಮ.  

ಇย౵  ಇඝ౬  ෨ಂං ಉഴ ಬฆವ ಉං౪ ೕಶಗัಛಜ, ಕකბಟಕ ಸಹ౽ರ ๸ಘಗಳ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 
1959ඝ౬  (1959 ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ ๸ಒ౲ : 11) ಮತ౨ ๠ౣ  ൟൿ౪ ಪല ෥ഴโൿ 
෷ಕ౨ ฿ಜฆโದคಂದ.  
            ಇൿ, ූರತ ಗಣฃಜ౲ ದ ಎಪ౭ ൤౨ ರಡඡ ವಷბದย౵  ಕකბಟಕ ฃಜ౲  เඋನ ෱ಡಲൽಂದ ಈ 
෨ಂൽඦ൤ ಅඌඛಯ෦ತ฿ಗย:- 

1. ๸౾౹ ಪ౨  ກಸฆ ಮൡ౨  ඩ౳ ฏಭ.- ಈ ಅඌඛಯಮವඝ౬  ಕකბಟಕ ಸಹ౽ರ ๸ಘಗಳ 
(ൟൿ౪ ಪല) ಅඌඛಯಮ, 2021 ಎಂൿ ಕฉಯತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  
 (2)ಇൿ, ಈ ಁಡศ ೦คಡ ಬರತಕౙ ൿ౪ .   

2. 2ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.-ಕකბಟಕ ಸಹ౽ರ ๸ಘಗಳ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1959ರ (1959ರ 
ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ ๸ಒ౲ :11) (ಇದರย౵  ಇඝ౬  ෨ಂං ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮๅಂൿ ಉว౵ ೕ಍ಸมಜං)  
2ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵  (ಇ-1-ಎ) ಘಡಃౙ  ಬದมಜ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

 “(ಇ-1-ಎ) “ಪ౳ ൟඛඌ” ಎಂದฉ, ಮ๻ ಸොಯย౵  ූಗವ๼๯ವ ಮൡ౨  ಮತಚม෵๯ವ 
ಅඌ౽ರඅಂൽಡ ಇತರ ಸಹ౽ರ ๸ಘಗಳย౵   ಆ ಸಹ౽ರ ๸ಘವඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟඛඌಸฤ ಮൡ౨  ಆತ ಪ౳ ൟඛඌ 
ಎಂൿ ෴โದಃౙ  ඡಮಕ฿ಜฆವඣೕ ಆ ಸಹ౽ರ ๸ಘದ ೋකವൕಯย౵  ಸ౷ ඌბಸฤ ಅಥ฿ 
ಅඝ෮ೕൽಸฤ ಅಥ฿ ෍ಂಬยಸฤ ෱ಡั෵ಂದ ඡಮಕ฿ದ ಸಹ౽ರ ๸ಘದ ඛඃბಶಕ.” 
 

3.6ඡಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 6ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (2)ඡ ಉಪ-ಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ ,- 
(i) (෈) ಘಡದ ಬದยಡ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪  ಎಂದฉ:- 

“(෈) ಎม౵  ಅ೧ბർರฆ ವ౲ ౾౨ ಗะಜฆವย౵ , ಅ೧ბർರರ ๸ಒ౲ ෷ ಇಪ౭ ತ౨ ౾ౙ ಂತ ಕല෫ 
ಇರತಕౙ ದ౪ ಲ౵  ಮൡ౨  ಅ೧ბർರฆ ಒಂඃ ಀഖಂಬಃౙ  ๳คರತಕౙ ದ౪ ಲ౵ ; ಮൡ౨ ” 

(ii) (෈) ಘಡದ ತฆ฿ಯ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ๳คಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 
 “(෈-1) ಎม౵  ಅ೧ბർರฆ ಸಹ౽ರ ๸ಘಗะಜದ౪ ย౵ , ಅ೧ბർರರ ๸ಒ౲ ෷ ಹൽ෩ರ౾ౙ ಂತ 

ಕല෫ ಇರತಕౙ ದ౪ ಲ౵ : 



 7 

ಪฏൡ ฃಜ౲  ಸ౽ბರโ เ๕ಷ ಪ౳ ಕರಣಗಳย౵  ಅ೧ბർರ ಸಹ౽ರ ๸ಘಗಳ ๸ಒ౲ ෷ 
ಹൽ෩ರ౾ౙ ಂತ ಕല෫෵ದ౪ ง ಅದඝ౬   ಅඝಮൟಸಬ๾ൿ.” 

4.17ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.-  ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 17ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ ,- 
 (i) (1)ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ “ಎෆ” ಘಡದ ಬದยಡ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 
 “(ಎෆ) ๸ಘದ ಅಥ฿ ಅದಃౙ  ಹಣ౽๯ ಒದಜ๯ವ ෇౲ ಂಀ ಅಥ฿  ಅದರ ಒ ౙಁ ಟ ಅಥ฿ 
ಅದರ ๸෷ಕ౨  ๸ಘൽಂದ ๸ಬಳ ಪഷ෷ವ ಉඅ౲ ೕಜ෴ಜದ౪ ฉ.” 

(ii) (2ಎ) ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ಬದยಡ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 
“(2-ಎ) ෴ช ವ౲ ౾౨ ෷ ಒಂඃ ಬಡಯ ವ౲ ವ๻ರ ನഷ๯ൟ౨ ฆವ ಎರഴ ಅಥ฿ ກ೉౞ ನ ಸಹ౽ರ 

๸ಘಗಳย౵  ಸದಸ౲ කಜฆโൿ ಅಥ฿ ಸದಸ౲ කಜ ෨ಂൿವฉ෷ൟ౨ ฆโൿ  ಉഴීದย౵ , 
ಕකბಟಕ ಸಹ౽ರ ๸ಘಗಳ (ൟൿ౪ ಪല) ಅඌඛಯಮ, 2021 ರ ඩ౳ ฏಭದ ൽකಂಕൽಂದ ൧ಂಬൡ౨  
ൽನಗಳ ಅವඌಯ ಒಳಛಜ ಆತನ ಆ෺ౙ ಯ ෴โඃ ಒಂൿ ๸ಘದย౵  ಸದಸ౲ ತ౷  ಉั๭ಆำ౶ โൿ 
ಆತඛಡ ෇ದ౲ ฿ಜರತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  ๻ಡ ෥ಡฤ ಆತඝ เಫಲකದฉ, ಆತ ຄಸർಜ ෴ವ ಸಹ౽ರ 
๸ಘಃౙ  ๳คฆವඣೕ ಅದರ ಸದಸ౲ ತ౷ โ ඛಂൡ ຄೕಞโංಂൿ ූเಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ .” 

5.  20ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 20ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (2)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ ,- 

(i) (ಎiii) ಘಡದ ಪฏൡಕದ ಬದยಡ, ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ,       
ಎಂದฉ:- 

“ಪฏൡ ಈ ಘಡದย౵ ฆโൿ ෴โ඀ ಅದರ ඣೕಂದ൐෴ದ ඛಕಟ ತฆ฿ಯ ನഷ෷ವ 
ಅಂಥ ๸ಘದ  ෮ದಲ ಮ๻ಸොಯย౵  ಮൡ౨  ๸ಘದ ಆಡัತ ෱ಡัಯ ෮ದಲ ೋකವൕಯย౵  
ූಗವ๼๯ವ ಸದಸ౲ ඛಡ ಅನ౷ ಯ฿ಗತಕౙ ದಲ౵ .” 

(ii) (ಎ-iv) ಘಡದ ಬದยಡ  ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

 “(ಎ-iv) ಆತඛಡ ෷ಕ౨ ฿ಜ ൟัಸมದ ಕึದ ಐൿ ฿๞ბಕ ಮ๻ ಸොಗಳ න౾ ಕඛಷౣ  ෴โඃ 
ಎರഴ ฿๞ბಕ ಮ๻ ಸොಡ ๻ಜฃಗฤ เಫಲකದ ಒಬ౯  ಸದಸ౲ , ಒಬ౯  ಪ౳ ൟඛඌ ಅಥ฿ ಒಬ౯  
ඛ෽ೕಜ.” 

 (iii)  ಪฏൡಕವඝ౬  ຄರൡಪല๭ (ಎ-V) ಘಡದ ಬದยಡ, ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬    
      ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

“(ಎ-V) ๼ಂൽನ ಐൿ ಸಹ౽ರ ವಷბಗಳ න౾ ෴โඃ ಎರഴ ಸಹ౽ರ ವಷბ౽ౙ ಜ 
ಉಪเඌಗಳย౵  ඛඌბಷౣ ಪലಸಬ๾ർඈಥ ಕඛಷౣ  ๳ๅಗಳඝ౬  ಅಥ฿ ๷ಲಭ౲ ಗಳඝ౬  ಬಳ๭ಆಳ౶ ฤ 
เಫಲකದ ಒಬ౯  ಸದಸ౲  ಅಥ฿ ಒಬ౯  ಪ౳ ൟඛඌ.” 

(iv) (ಎ-V) ಘಡದ ಅലಯย౵ ನ ಪฏൡಕದย౵  “෩ฆ ವಷბಗಳ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗัಡ “ಒಂൿ 
ವಷბದ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

(v)  (෈) ಘಡದย౵ ನ เವರൕಯย౵  “ಹൽජൿ ൽನಗัಡ” ಮൡ౨  “෩ವൡ౨  ൽನಗัಡ” ಎಂಬ 
ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ  “ಇಪ౭ ൧౨ ಂൿ ൽನಗัಡ” ಮൡ౨  “ನಲವ൤౨ ೖൿ ൽನಗัಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  
ಅඝಕ౳ ಮ฿ಜ ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

 

6. 22ඡ ຄಸ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ¸ÉÃಪბഷ.-  ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 21ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ತฆ฿ಯ, ಈ 

෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ๳คಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

“22. µÉÃฆಗಳඝ౬  ຄಂൽฆโದರ ෬ว ඛಬბಂಧಗำ:- ෴โඃ ಸಹ౽ค ๸ಘದย౵ , 

ಸ౽ბರವಲ౵ ದ ෴ช ಸದಸ౲ ඝ ಅಥ฿ ฃಜ౲  ಸ౽ბರದ තವბ ෱೪ฃൟ ಪഷൿ ෴โඃ ಇತರ 
ಸಹ౽ರ ๸ಘ,  ฃಜ౲  ಉಛ౳ ಣ ඛಗಮ ಅಥ฿ ಕකბಟಕ ಛ౳ ಮ ಸ౷ ฃ೴  ಮൡ౨  ඵೈಯ൬  ฃ೴  
ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1993ರ (1993ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ ๸ಒ౲  14)  ಅലಯย౵  ರ೉ಸมದ  ೧ม౵  
ඵೈ෵ൟ ಅಥ฿ ෴โඃ ๎ಸನಬದ౫  ಅಥ฿ ๎ಸನಬದ౫ ವಲ౵ ದ  ෱ಡั, ಸ෦ൟ ಅಥ฿ ඛಗಮโ 



8 

ඛಯ෦ಸಬ๾ർඈ൤  ๸ಘದ ಒഖౣ  ๤ฆ ීಡ฿ಳದย౵   ๕ಕಡ ಐದರಷౣ ඝ౬  ෦ೕರඈಥ 
ූಗ౾ౙ ಂತ ກ೉౞ ನ ๤ರඝ౬  ຄಂದತಕౙ ದ౪ ಲ౵ :” 

 

7.  27ಎ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 27ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ ,- 

(i)  (ಎ) ಘಡದย౵  “෩ฆ” ಎಂಬ ಪದದ ಬದยಡ “ಎರഴ” ಎಂಬ ಪದವඝ౬    
 ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ;  

 (ii) (෈) ಘಡದย౵  “ಉಪเඌಗಳย౵ ”  ಎಂಬ ಪದದ ෮ದยಡ  “ಕึದ ಐൿ ಸಹ౽ค 
 ವಷბಗಳย౵   ෴โඃ ಎರഴ ಸಹ౽ค ವಷბಗัಛಜ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬   ๳คಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 
 ಮൡ౨   

(iii) ಪฏൡಕದย౵  “෩ฆ ವಷბಗಳ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಒಂൿ ವಷბ”ದ ಎಂಬ      
ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 
 

 8.  28ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 28ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ  (2)ඡ ಉಪ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ 
ತฆ฿ಯ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ๳คಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

 “(3) เ๕ಷ ಮ๻ಸොಛಜ ಆೕฏ, 27ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (4) ඡ ಉಪ-ಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵  
ඛඌბಷౣ ಪല๭ඈ൤෻  ಇರತಕౙ ൿ౪ .” 
 

 9.   29 ๭ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.-  ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 29๭ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ ,- 

(i)  (1)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (ಎ) ಘಡದย౵  “ಸಹ౽ರ ๸ಘಃౙ ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ತฆ฿ಯ “ಅಥ฿ 
๷๻ದბ ಸಹ౽คಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ๳คಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

(ii) (8)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (ല) ಘಡದย౵   “ಅನಹბತัಸಬ๾ൿ” ಎಂಬ ಪದದ ಬದยಡ 
“൤ಡൿ๻ಕಬ๾ൿ ಮൡ౨  ಅನಹბತัಸಬ๾ൿ” ಎಂಬ ಪದವඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  
 

 10. 29ಇ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല,-  ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 29ಇ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ ,  ෮ದಲ ಪฏൡಕದ 
ತฆ฿ಯ, ಈ ෨ಂൽನ ಪฏൡಕವඝ౬  ๳คಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

 “ಮൡ౨   ಪฏൡ ෱ಡัಯ ಅಂತಹ คಕ౨  ๬౩ ನ౽ౙ ಜ ೋකವൕ ನഷ෷ವವฉಡ, ಉದ౰ ವ฿ಞವ 
൞൞ౙ ยಕ ๬౩ ನಃౙ  ๸ීඌ๭ඈ൤, ಅඃ ವಗბದ ಸದಸ౲ ฆಗಳ න౾ කಮඛඃბಶನದ ෩ಲಕ  
෱ಡัಯ ൞൞ౙ ยಕ ๬౩ ನವඝ౬  ಭൟბ ෥ಡಬ๾ൿ.” 
 

 11. 39 ಎಎ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 39 ಎಎ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ, (2)ඡ ಉಪ-
ಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵  “ಮತർರ ಪഔౣ ಗಳඝ౬ ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ  “ಮತർರರ ಪഔౣ ಗಳඝ౬ ” ಎಂಬ 
ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 
 

 12.    39ಐ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 39ಐ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ ,- 

  (i)   (4)ඡ ಉಪ-ಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵  “ಈ ಪ౳ ಕರಣโ ಅನ౷ ಯ฿ಞವ ವ౲ ౾౨ ಗึಂದฉ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ 
ತฆ฿ಯ  “ೋකವ൏   ಅඌ౽คಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ๳คಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; ಮൡ౨  

  (ii) “඲ೕยಂ಩ ಆඹೕಸฑ ಗำ ಮൡ౨ ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ತฆ฿ಯ “ಮತർರರ ಪഔౣ ಯඝ౬  
๭ದ౫ ಪല๯โದ౽ౙ ಜ ಅಥ฿ ”  ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ๳คಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 
 

 13. 68ඡಪ౳ ಕರಣದൟൿ౪ ಪല.-෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 68ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ , (1)ඡ ಉಪ 
ಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ :- 

 (i) “ඛඃბ๏ಸಬ๾ൿ” ಎಂಬ ಪದದ ಬದยಡ “ ඛඃბ๏ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ” ಎಂಬ ಪದವඝ౬   
 ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; ಮൡ౨  



 9 

(ii) “ಪർඌ౽คಗಳඝ౬ ”ಎಂಬ ಪದದ ತฆ฿ಯ “63ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ಅലಯย౵ ನ วಕౙ  
 ಪค๗ೕಧක ವರൽಯย౵  ಅಥ฿”ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ๳คಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  

 

 14. 72ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.-෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 72ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (5)ඡ ಉಪ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ 
ತฆ฿ಯ, ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ๳คಸತಕౙ ൿ౪  ಎಂದฉ:- 

 “(6) ෬ಲౙ ಂಡ (1), (2) ಮൡ౨  (5) ඡ ಉಪ ಪ౳ ಕರಣಗಳ ಅലಯย౵  ಸಹ౽ರ ๸ಘದ 
ಸ෥ಪನತั๯ವ ಪ౳ ౾౳ ෺෷ ค೧๬ౣ იฑ ಅವฆ ඛඃბಶನ ඛೕലದ ൽකಂಕൽಂದ ෩ฆ ವಷბಗಳ 
ಅವඌ෽ಳಡ ෨౽౨ ಯತಳౙ ತಕౙ ൿ౪ : 

 ಪฏൡ ย಍ತದย౵  ർಖยಸ෎౽ದ ౽ರಣಗัಛಜ ค೧๬ౣ იರฆ, ಸದค ಅವඌಯඝ౬  ಒಂൿ 
ವಷბದ ಮ൧౨ ಂൿ ಅವඌಡ เಸ౨ คಸಬ๾ൿ: 

ಮൡ౨  ಪฏൡ ฃಜ౲  ಸ౽ბರโ, ค೧๬ౣ იರඝ ෥ലದ ವರൽಯ ෬ว, เಸ౨ ರൕಛಜ ජಜ 
౽ರಣಗัๅ෺ಂൿ ಮನಧಡฉ, ർಖยಸ෎౽ದ ౽ರಣಗัಛಜ ಅವඌಯඝ౬  เಸ౨ ค๯ವ 
ಅඌ౽ರವඝ౬  ຄಂൽರತಕౙ ൿ౪ .” 

 

15. ಸಹ౽ರ ೋකವ൏ ඩ౳ ඌ౽ರದ ಪർವัಯ ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕಜච.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದย౵  
“ಸಹ౽ರ ೋකವൕ ಆ෽ೕಗ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗำ ಬฆವ ಕഷಗึว౵ ม౵ , “ಸಹ౽ರ ೋකವ൏ ඩ౳ ඌ౽ರ” 
ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 

The above translation of the Karnataka Co-operative Societies (Amendment) 
Act, 2021(Karnataka Act 36 of 2021) shall be authoritative text in the Kannada 
language under section 5A of the Karnataka Official Language Act, 1963 
(Karnataka Act 26 of 1963). 

൭ವฑ  ೔ඊ   ಡຄ౵ ೕഡ 
ಕකბಟಕ ฃಜ౲ ඩಲฆ 

 
ಕකბಟಕ ฃಜ౲ ඩಲರ ಆඃ๎ඝ๬ರ 

ಮൡ౨  ಅವರ ກಸคನย౵ , 
 

      (೧. ๏౳ ೕಧฑ) 
ಸ౽ბರದ ౽ಯბದ๏ბ, 

๸ಸൽೕಯ ವ౲ ವ๻ರಗำ ಮൡ౨  
๎ಸನ ರಚච ಇมಒ 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

 

ಮುದÎಕರು ²ಾಗೂ ಪÎ�ಾಶಕರು:- ಸಂಕಲ£ಾĩ�ಾĸಗಳ�, ಕ£ಾ�ಟಕ ªಾಜÍಪತÎ, ಸ�ಾ�ĸ �ೇಂದÎ ಮುದÎ�ಾಲಯ, ¦ೆಂಗಳ�ರು 

R.N.I.  No. KARBIL/2001/47147  POSTAL REGN. No. RNP/KA/BGS/2202/2017-19 

Licensed to post without prepayment   WPP No. 297 


		2021-10-07T18:23:20+0530
	SUNIL GARDE




